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Executive Summary

The University Report 2017 is the fifth report 
submitted to the Austrian National Council, 
which covers the public universities’ previous 
developments and future orientation and espe-
cially focuses on fostering young scientists, on 
developments with regard to universities’ staff-
ing, and the situation of students. The report is 
based mainly on the universities’ reports that 
were submitted from 2014 to 2017, in particular 
on the financial statements and intellectual 
capital reports from 2014 to 2016.

The University Report focuses primarily on 
the 22 public universities, which are part of a 
diversified Austrian higher education area. Fur-
thermore, cross-sectoral strategy processes, 
or collaborations and permeability, respective-
ly, are becoming increasingly more important 
for a systematic further development of the 
Austrian higher education area in all of its parts 
and especially in its qualitative entirety. 

Within the framework of the legal mandate 
pursuant to § 11 Universities Act (UG), the re-
port seeks to capture the necessary broader 
perspective in its description of the develop-
ments at public universities, which also in-
cludes the other sectors forming the Austrian 
higher education area – universities of applied 
sciences, university colleges of teacher edu-
cation, private universities. The report shows 
that the public university sector remains to be 
the most dominant sector, quantitatively, but 
it also describes their interdependencies and 
interactions with the other sectors, e.g. in the 
context of cross-sectional strategies, in con-
nection with strategic projects such as “Shap-
ing HEIs for the Future“, key cross-cutting re-
form plans such as the newly structured 
teacher training, or within the framework of 
the forecast of higher education or develop-
ments in the labour market with regard to ac-
ademics. 

The University Report 2017 gives account of 
the years 2014 to the end of 2017 and the 
changes and developments that have affected 
the university sector during the reporting peri-
od. It also covers pending and future develop-
ments. This brief summary is based on the re-
port’s executive summary, giving an overview 
of the most important  contents of the ten 
chapters; figures and tables were not included. 
Each chapter is preceded by an introduction, 
which focuses on the key developments in the 

corresponding subject area and includes an 
outlook where applicable. 

The full report in German consists of 331 
pages and is available for download on the web-
site of the Federal Ministry of Education, Sci-
ence and Research: https://bmbwf.gv.at/filead-
min/user_upload/wissenschaft/publikationen/
Universit%C3%A4tsbericht_2017_barriere-
frei_20180312.pdf.

Please note:

At the time of the completion and publishing of 
the University Report 2017, a new federal gov-
ernment had taken office and a change of the 
departments’ responsibilities had been intro-
duced. An amendment to the Federal Ministries 
Act came into force on 8 January 2018, which 
merged the areas “science and research” and 
“education” to a new department “Federal Min-
istry of Education, Science and Research”. The 
report, which at this point had already been fi-
nalised, uses the names that were valid 
throughout the reporting period from 2014 to 
2017, especially “Federal Ministry of Science, 
Research and Economy” (BMWFW) and “Feder-
al Ministry of Education“ (BMB).

1 Further developing and strengthening 
the Austrian higher education area

Austrian universities are well established in the 
Austrian higher education area as well as in the 
international scientific community. Since 
wide-ranging autonomy was given to the uni-
versities in the Universities Act 2002 (UG), the 
paradigm “better performing universities 
through more competition” has proved effec-
tive. Universities are the motors of innovation 
for our country and – despite the difficult con-
ditions – have managed to advance academi-
sation in our society successfully. The increas-
ing numbers of students show that. Now, the 
task is to guarantee sustainable funding and to 
link the expansion of the university of applied 
sciences sector to alleviating effects for the 
university sector. 

Further developing and strengthening the 
Austrian higher education area must be seen 
as a process, which is driven forward in a con-
text-related way. During the reporting period, 
recommendations of the Austrian Higher Edu-

Introduction

https://bmbwf.gv.at/fileadmin/user_upload/wissenschaft/publikationen/Universit%C3%A4tsbericht_2017_barrierefrei_20180312.pdf
https://bmbwf.gv.at/fileadmin/user_upload/wissenschaft/publikationen/Universit%C3%A4tsbericht_2017_barrierefrei_20180312.pdf
https://bmbwf.gv.at/fileadmin/user_upload/wissenschaft/publikationen/Universit%C3%A4tsbericht_2017_barrierefrei_20180312.pdf
https://bmbwf.gv.at/fileadmin/user_upload/wissenschaft/publikationen/Universit%C3%A4tsbericht_2017_barrierefrei_20180312.pdf
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cation Conference (Österreichische Hochschul-
konferenz) as well as overlapping strategic 
processes provided impulses, which have an 
impact on all sectors of the higher education 
area. The strategic project “Shaping higher ed-
ucation institutions (HEIs) for the Future“ elab-
orates on differentiation and cooperation as 
main aspects of further qualitative develop-
ment, taking into consideration not only the 
universities but also the universities of applied 
sciences. Over the next few years, an empha-
sis will be put on strengthening the position of 
the Austrian universities and other higher edu-
cation institutions – both in an international 
context, and also in their task to provide orien-
tation for Austrian society. The BMWFW’s main 
lines of action will focus on: 
•	 further differentiating the higher education 

landscape by means of comprehensible and 
clear profiles and tasks of HEIs;

•	 promoting collaborations and strong net-
work structures or clusters;

•	 encouraging creativity and providing a 
scope for individual action (among staff and 
students);

•	 achieving a balanced participation in educa-
tion and further training which reflects the 
diversity of the broader population.

The Austrian National Development Plan for 
Public Universities (GUEP) as a strategic plan-
ning instrument for the university sector refers 
to these lines of action. Within the framework 
of its objective 1 – “Further develop and 
strengthen the higher education system” – it 
takes account of the fact that universities act 
as a part of the Austrian higher education area 
and that differentiation, the development of 
profiles and the division of tasks, linked with 
closer cooperation and better permeability 
contributes to strengthening the Austrian high-
er education system and enhancing its com-
petitiveness. Furthermore, the GUEP moves 
two issues into focus, which will be relevant not 
only for the universities, but also for the fur-
ther development of the entire Austrian higher 
education area: the issue of integrating the 
principle of sustainability and the role of digital 
transformation in higher education.

Higher Education Conference
The Austrian Higher Education Conference 
plays an important strategic role in strength-
ening the dialogue on higher education policy 
issues between the different sectors. During 
2015 and 2017 the Higher Education Confer-
ence adopted two recommendations to be im-
plemented in the further development of the 

Austrian higher education area, providing key 
impulses. In June 2015 the “Recommendation 
of the Higher Education Conference on the fur-
ther qualitative development of doctoral train-
ing in Austria” (“Empfehlung der Hochschul-
konferenz zur qualitativen Weiterentwicklung 
der Doktoratsausbildung in Österreich”) was 
adopted. Based on this recommendation, key 
quality aspects were subsequently adopted as 
criteria for the funding of structured doctoral 
programmes by means of Higher Education 
Area Structural Funds (HRSM). In December 
2015 the “Recommendations of the Austrian 
Higher Education Conference on supporting 
non-traditional access to higher education” 
(“Empfehlungen der Hochschulkonferenz zur 
Förderung nicht-traditioneller Zugänge im ge-
samten Hochschulsektor”) were published. 
They can be seen as a supportive measure for 
improving social participation and the permea-
bility between the sectors of the higher educa-
tion area. A working group on “Improving gen-
der competence in higher education process-
es” (“Verbreiterung der Genderkompetenz in 
hochschulischen Prozessen“) completed its 
work at the end of 2017. The results will be 
published in 2018.

The project “Shaping HEIs for the Future”
In spring 2016, the BMWFW started the project 
“Shaping HEIs for the Future” (“Zukunft Hoch-
schule”), which was aimed at the strategic fur-
ther development of the Austrian higher edu-
cation system. In addition to improving the ca-
pacities of the university of applied sciences 
sector, it provided for an examination and opti-
misation of the following areas:
•	 pronunciation of educational profiles of uni-

versities (scientific/artistic and pre-voca-
tional) and universities of applied sciences 
(practice-oriented training on a higher edu-
cation level);

•	 a structure based on division and comple-
mentarity of tasks and/or the coordination 
of the degree programmes offered; 

•	 permeability within the higher education 
sector. 

Along five “action areas” and within the frame-
work of a discussion and working process in 29 
workshops, representatives of public universi-
ties, universities of applied sciences and the 
Austrian Science Council, all in all a collabora-
tion of 329 participants from 31 higher educa-
tion institutions, developed concept papers, 
which were completed in the summer of 2017. 
The process involved the fields of law studies, 
studies in economic sciences, life sciences, 
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computer sciences, and studies in humanities 
and cultural sciences, and also addressed the 
cross-cutting issues “improvement of permea-
bility” and “further development of the univer-
sities of applied sciences’ portfolios”. 

As a result, the characteristics and distin-
guishing features of the university sector as 
well as the university of applied sciences sector 
were clarified, and the potential for further co-
operation identified. A quota of at least 30% of 
the total enrolment numbers of both sectors 
was specified as a mid-term goal for the expan-
sion of the university of applied sciences sector. 
A broad consensus was reached regarding the 
topics for a coordinated development of the 
universities of applied sciences’ portfolios, also 
taking into consideration the aspect of relieving 
the university sector. In future, the number of 
dual degree programmes as well as part-time 
programmes and joint degree programmes be-
tween universities of applied sciences and uni-
versities shall be increased. As a result of the 
coordination process, it was clarified that the 
further development in the fields of economic 
studies and computer science studies shall fo-
cus on increasing staff capacities and improv-
ing the student-teacher ratios in the university 
sector, as well as on increasing the numbers of 
study places at universities of applied sciences. 
Furthermore, the requirements for a transfer 
from bachelor to master shall be made trans-
parent in a standardised way. In the field of 
studies in humanities and cultural sciences, 
first steps towards coordination and supra-re-
gional courses and/or teaching cooperations 
were identified. It was agreed that it is neces-
sary to introduce admission regulations for law 
studies in order to improve the student-teacher 
ratio and reduce the drop-out rate. An “inter-
facultary working group on mobility”, which 
was set up in the course of the process, agreed 
on a mutual recognition of study achievements 
in core subjects.

The outcomes of the project “Shaping HEIs 
for the Future” will be included in governance 
and steering instruments of the ministry: in 
the Austrian National Development Plan for 
Public Universities, in the performance agree-
ments with the universities, as well as in the 
Development and Funding Plan for Universities 
of Applied Sciences.

National strategy on the social dimension of 
higher education
At the Yerevan Ministerial Conference in 2015, 
the member states agreed to develop national 
strategies for promoting the social dimension 
in the higher education sector. The same ob-

jectives are pursued also by means of the min-
istry’s impact-oriented budgeting and by the 
Austrian National Development Plan for Public 
Universities. 

Following a broad discussion and consulta-
tion process with higher education institutions, 
social partners and counselling service institu-
tions, the BMWFW developed the “National 
strategy on the social dimension of higher ed-
ucation. Towards a more inclusive access and 
wider participation“ in 2016. Beforehand, a 
survey on already existing measures address-
ing the social dimension had been completed, 
which shows that a number of relevant pro-
jects are already being implemented by higher 
education institutions. It is planned to expand 
these measures as well as to create new ones 
to be embedded in the institutions’ develop-
ment plans.

The national strategy lays out three target 
dimensions with three action lines and corre-
sponding measures for each, which shall be 
implemented by 2025: 
Target dimension I “More inclusive access” pri-

marily addresses the quality and accessibil-
ity of information materials and guidance or 
counselling services, outreach activities, 
the recognition and validation of non-formal 
and informal competencies. 

Target dimension II “Avoid drop-out and im-
prove academic success“ refers to the 
structure of study programmes (i.a. in-
creasing the compatibility of studying with 
other areas of life), the entry into higher ed-
ucation (i.a. establishing a “culture of wel-
come“) and the quality of teaching. 

Target dimension III “Create basic parameters 
and optimise the regulation of higher edu-
cation policy“ addresses system-related is-
sues in higher education systems (e.g. fur-
ther developing legal provisions with regard 
to “studyability”,  monitoring “studyability”, 
reviewing higher education funding and its 
effect on the social dimension) as well as 
the topics of creating appropriate govern-
ance structures at higher education institu-
tions and of improving student support 
schemes.

The broader objectives include nine quantita-
tive goals to be achieved by 2025, e.g. reducing 
underrepresentation of students whose par-
ents do not have higher education entrance 
qualifications, increasing the number of 
non-traditional admissions as well as the ad-
mission of students with migrant backgrounds 
to higher education, and promoting gender 
balance in all degree programmes. 
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An interim evaluation is scheduled for 2021. 
The 2017 amendment of the Student Support 
Act (Studienförderungsgesetz) has already re-
sulted in significant improvements with regard 
to student support.

The Higher Education Mobility Strategy of the 
Federal Ministry of Science, Research and 
Economy
In our globalised world, mobility experience 
and stays abroad are becoming increasingly 
important for the labour market and for an ac-
ademic career. Pursuant to the 2012 Bucharest 
Communiqué and the Mobility strategy 2020 
for the European Higher Education Area, all Eu-
ropean countries shall develop and implement 
their own internationalisation and mobility 
strategies. 

In August 2016 the BMWFW presented its 
“Higher Education Mobility Strategy” (“Hoch-
schulmobilitätsstrategie”) with strategic goals, 
measures and recommendations to support 
transnational mobility at Austrian universities, 
universities of applied sciences and private uni-
versities. It focuses mainly on enhancing the 
quality of mobility of students, teachers, re-
searchers and non-academic staff. The Higher 
Education Mobility Strategy has defined 16 ac-
tion lines, which recommend further steps con-
cerning, i.a. framework conditions or the phases 
before, during and following mobility abroad. 
Some of these measures have already been im-
plemented (e.g. measures in the field of curric-
ular design, measures to optimise information 
materials, to make use of experiences gained 
during periods spent abroad, as well as meas-
ures to foster “international experience at 
home”). The Higher Education Mobility Strategy 
has also defined three quantitative targets: In 
2025 30% to 35% of those graduating at an Aus-
trian higher education institution should have 
spent a study period abroad. By 2021 120,000 
students in Austria should have taken part in 
the ERASMUS+ programme (the goal of 100,000 
participations set for 2018 has already been 
met). By 2020 at least 4,500 members of the 
scientific or artistic university staff should have 
had an activity-based period spent abroad.

Necessary modifications identified in the 
course of implementation will be addressed in 
an update of the strategy.

2  Funding and governance

The universities are funded mainly from public 
funds. A study on the economic and social ef-
fects of universities published in 2017 by the 
Austrian Institute of Economic Research (WIFO) 

proves that these funds are well invested. Ac-
cording to the study, the services and achieve-
ments of universities are not only important 
factors for location decisions in business and 
industry, and thus for growth and competitive-
ness. Universities also generate positive re-
turns for the state after a relatively short time 
through economic effects on the demand and 
supply side. Sums invested in universities turn 
out to be profitable after a mere three to five 
years. 

Over the past few years, the federal govern-
ment has successfully increased the university 
budget. For the performance agreement period 
of 2016–2018, a total of €9.7 billion were avail-
able for the universities, that is €615  million 
more than in the previous period. In addition, a 
path was agreed upon to increase the universi-
ties’ efficiency and thus yield around €300 mil-
lion to remain at the universities’ disposal. This 
significant increase in expenditure was accom-
panied by an equally significant increase of 
student numbers. Because of insufficient pos-
sibilities for controlling student flows, the stu-
dent-teacher ratios could be improved only 
partially and not to the desired extent. The 
preparations for a new model for financing uni-
versities in the future were continued and in-
tensified during this reporting period, aiming at 
improving the student-teacher ratios in popular 
degree programmes, and at a state-of-the-art 
financing of academic research/advancement 
and appreciation of the arts. In this context, 
also uniform standards were defined for cost 
and activity accounting at public universities.

In its decision of 28 June 2017, the National 
Council established the university budget pur-
suant to § 12 para. 2 Universities Act (UG) for 
the performance agreement period 2019–2021 
at €11.070 billion. The federal government was 
assigned the task of drawing up a government 
bill for a capacity-oriented, student-based 
funding of universities before the end of Janu-
ary 2018. The corresponding legislative pro-
posal was assessed and further edited in the 
autumn of 2017. The implementation of the new 
model for university funding has to be accom-
panied by adequate legal provisions allowing 
the federal government in cooperation with the 
universities to regulate the access according to 
the available capacities. 

Higher education funding, and the question 
of how to finance what, is inextricably linked 
with the issue of governance and steering. Effi-
cient steering approaches in higher education 
must take into consideration two dimensions – 
a resource-related steering dimension and an 
issue-related or issue-driven steering dimen-
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sion. In order to achieve an ideal form of inter-
action of these dimensions, which is crucial for 
the qualitative further development and inter-
national competitiveness of Austrian universi-
ties and the entire Austrian higher education 
area, suitable steering mechanisms and instru-
ments are necessary. With a tiered governance 
model for the university sector, the Austrian 
National Development Plan for Public Universi-
ties (GUEP) and the performance agreements, 
Austria has a set of instruments that meet 
these demands. The GUEP has integrated both 
dimensions. It includes the parameters “stu-
dents” and “staff” for resource-related and ca-
pacity-oriented steering as well as the priority 
areas for issue-related steering. The govern-
ance instrument “performance agreement“ 
puts both dimensions into concrete terms for 
the individual university. In the context of the 
2017 revision of the GUEP, the groundwork was 
laid for the implementation of the new model 
for university financing as of 2019, as well as 
for a future-oriented development of universi-
ties, which takes into account the fundamental 
importance of universities for social and eco-
nomic development.

Higher education funding and steering re-
quire transparency in order to receive accep-
tance of the whole society and of the institu-
tions and stakeholders concerned. The new in-
dicator-based funding model for universities 
satisfies this demand for transparency. In the 
future, it will be necessary to increase the sig-
nificance of data evidence and indicators for 
steering activities as well as for monitoring 
university performance – not only to steer the 
contributions of the individual universities, but 
also to make visible their performance and its 
effect in the overall social context. 

Funding of universities
Annual federal expenses within the so-called 
“higher education budget” have increased by 
9.3% in the reporting period since 2013, the 
expenses directly attributable to the university 
sector have risen by 8.1%; this corresponds to 
the increase in GDP (+8.3%). Federal expendi-
ture merely rose by 1%. The annual federal ex-
penditure, excluding those directly attributable 
to the university sector, amounted to €3.447 bil-
lion in 2016 (4.5% of the federal budget).

Within the performance agreement period 
2013–2015, which ran out during the reporting 
period, the federal government allocated 
€9.1  billion for the funding of universities, 
which is 8.9% more than during the previous 
period. Part of the additional funds (€450 mil-
lion) were dedicated to the Higher Education 

Area Structural Funds (HRSM), which have re-
placed the hitherto existing formula and are al-
located based on indicators or calls for cooper-
ation projects. 

For the performance agreement period 
2016–2018 the university budget was success-
fully increased by another €615  million, 
€315  million going to the basic budgets and 
€300 million going to the HRSM. Corresponding 
to the international tendency, indicator-based 
funds were increased more (+67%) than basic 
funding (+3.8%). In connection with the in-
crease of the HRSM, the former component for 
private donations was replaced by a compo-
nent for structured doctoral programmes in or-
der to promote the qualitative development of 
doctoral training and to strengthen basic re-
search. Including the compensation universi-
ties received for the loss of tuition fees 
(€157 million per year), a total of around €9.721 
billion are available to the universities in the 
period of 2016–2018, that is an increase of 
6.8% in comparison to the previous period. 

Increasing the universities’ efficiency
When fixing the budget funds for universities in 
2015 it was decided that universities will also 
implement internal structural reforms and, by 
increasing their efficiency, will gain additional 
budgetary room for manoeuvre. The path en-
visaged to increase the universities’ efficiency 
shall result in efficiency gains of around 
€300 million between 2016 and 2018, to remain 
at the universities’ disposal. Concrete meas-
ures were agreed upon with the individual uni-
versities and monitored as to their expected 
cost savings. The measures concern staffing, 
the field of teaching and studies, infrastructure 
and buildings, and also include other efficiency 
measures, e.g. in administration. All universi-
ties started implementing the measures agreed 
upon, most of the measures becoming effec-
tive during the first year of the performance 
agreement period. By the end of 2016, already 
a third of the steps had been taken on the path 
to increasing universities’ efficiency.

Cooperation projects from the Higher 
Education Area Structural Funds
In the performance agreement period 2016–
2018 the Higher Education Area Structural 
Funds (HRSM) available for cooperation pro-
jects of universities were increased to a total of 
€97.5 million. In 2016 there were three sepa-
rate competitive calls, aiming at the areas of 
teaching, research/advancement and appreci-
ation of the arts, and administration and man-
agement.
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The area of teaching was endowed with a 
total of €35 million, the call for proposals fo-
cused on projects promoting the new teacher 
training and the joint degree programmes for 
secondary teacher training (general education) 
offered together with university colleges of 
teacher education; the Quality Assurance 
Council of Teacher Education was involved in 
the assessment of the submitted proposals for 
cooperation projects. The HRSM funds will 
make it possible to create 82 new positions in 
the four regional clusters (“Verbundregionen”), 
thus strengthening the specialised pedagogy 
staff, fostering young scientists and improving 
the administrative infrastructure for the new 
teacher training programmes.

For the HRSM call in the area of research, 
there was an amount of €50 million available 
for the modernisation, expansion, and new ac-
quisition of research infrastructure, predomi-
nantly in the area of basic research. There was 
a focus on cooperation projects to provide and 
make accessible modern, high-tech (large-
scale) research and data infrastructure as well 
as on cooperation projects to modernise and 
further develop existing R&D-infrastructure, 
thus fostering structural developments and 
supporting excellence. Furthermore, the uni-
versities were able to propose “unconvention-
al” research projects and innovative projects 
for arts-based research – especially in the area 
of the advancement and appreciation of the 
arts. Involving the expertise of international 
peers, 46 cooperation projects were selected 
from among 90 proposals.

The third HRSM call was dedicated to the 
area of innovative administration and manage-
ment and provided incentives to modernise 
and harmonise administration processes. The 
€12.5 million available have been invested pri-
marily in two nationwide projects: a joint pro-
ject among all universities aiming at develop-
ing uniform standards for cost and activity ac-
counting at universities during the implement-
ing phase; and a project in the field of Open 
Access, the goal of which is to create the nec-
essary framework at universities in order to 
make research findings and scientific publica-
tions openly accessible and free of charge.

Building projects of universities
The Austrian development plan for buildings is 
a planning instrument for building projects of 
universities, which was incorporated into law 
by the 2015 amendment of the Universities Act 
2002 (UG) in §§  118a and 118b. Pursuant to 
§ 118b UG, the realisation and funding of build-
ing projects shall be agreed upon by the feder-

al minister and the university involved. The 
specific proceedings for the realisation of build-
ing projects of universities that exceed a spec-
ified limit are laid down in the Decree on the 
Planning Procedure and Realisation of Building 
Projects of Universities (Uni-ImmoV), the draft 
of which was assessed in autumn of 2017.

During the reporting period, from 2014 to 
2017, building projects of universities amount-
ed to a total investment of about €380 million. 
Among those projects were the new Med Cam-
pus Modul 1 of the Medical University of Graz 
and nine projects from the Federal Real Estate 
Company‘s (BIG) special building programme 
2014. In February 2017 a new special building 
programme was initiated, aiming at investing 
profit distributions by BIG amounting to 
€150 million in 12 building projects. Since the 
number of students has risen in the past dec-
ades and there is an increasing demand for 
space, the chosen building projects not only in-
clude building refurbishments, but also new 
constructions and building extensions. 

A new model for university funding
The National Council has dedicated a total sum 
of €11.070 billion to the funding of public uni-
versities for the performance agreement peri-
od 2019–2021 by federal law (Federal Law Ga-
zette  I No  129/2017) and commissioned the 
federal government with the development of 
an implementation model for a capacity-ori-
ented, student-based funding of universities 
by 31 January 2018. Following this duty, a bill 
was submitted for assessment on 1  August 
2017, which was based on the former federal 
act published in Federal Law Gazette.  I 
No 52/2013 as well as on a funding model de-
veloped in coordination with the Federal Minis-
try of Finance (BMF) and Universities Austria 
(uniko). Simultaneously with the implementa-
tion of a capacity-oriented funding of universi-
ties, nationwide as well as university-related 
admission regulations shall be made possible 
whenever the figures for the student-teacher 
ratio in the degree programme concerned ex-
ceed a certain limit.

This new model for university funding is 
based on a capacity-oriented, student-related 
funding scheme. The Austrian National Devel-
opment Plan for Public Universities stipulates 
the goals and framing parameters for further 
developing the universities. The contributions 
of the individual universities are negotiated 
and contracted by performance agreements. 
For their implementation, the universities will 
continue to receive a global budget. The global 
budget of each university will consist of three 
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components, for the performance areas “teach-
ing“, “research/advancement and appreciation 
of the arts“ as well as “infrastructure and stra-
tegic development“ (three-pillar model). Spe-
cific indicators and seven weighted groups of 
disciplines form the basis for calculating the 
budget components for the first two areas: the 
number of students who actively take exami-
nations (with equal or more than 16 ECTS - 
“study places“) and the number of scientific or 
artistic staff (“basic performance research/ad-
vancement and appreciation of the arts“). Fur-
thermore, competition indicators like the num-
ber of graduates, the number of students with 
equal or more than 40 ECTS (“quick students”), 
third-party research funding, structured doc-
toral programmes, provide additional incen-
tives.

A novelty is the linking of funds to a suc-
cessful implementation of measures which aim 
to promote the social dimension in teaching 
and the social diversification of students. In or-
der to ensure that these measures are real-
ised, up to 0.5% of the universities’ global 
budget may be retained until evidence is pro-
vided that the measures have been effectively 
implemented.

Cost and activity accounting 
Pursuant to §  16 para.  1 UG, each university 
shall install an accounting system, which in-
cludes cost and activity accounting (KLR). In 
March 2017 the Decree on Uniform Principles 
for Cost and Activity Accounting at Universities 
(KLRV) entered into force, which in future shall 
provide for information on cost structures in 
the universities’ most important tasks in the 
area of teaching and  research as well as in 
other services offered. It will also be possible 
to show which costs are incurred by which ser-
vices. The legal provisions developed are tak-
ing into account the universities’ autonomy; 
therefore, most of the regulations merely de-
termine minimum standards. Data on the costs 
for the provision of services as well as key per-
formance indicators (e.g. costs for teaching per 
student who actively takes examinations, per 
group of discipline) will also be submitted to 
the Federal Ministry of Science, Research and 
Economy (BMWFW).

The universities are given five years to im-
plement the provisions of the KLRV internally, 
and will be supported by means of HRSM funds; 
the last two years shall be used for intensive 
tests and data validation. The first verified real 
data from the KLR systems of the 22 universi-
ties will be submitted to the BMWFW by 2021 
(concerning the year 2020).

The financial and economic situation of the 
public universities
Since 2008, the public universities are subject 
to “treasury and subsidiary controlling” by the 
BMF and have been required to also submit a 
“risk disclosure statement” for three years 
now. 

The universities are obliged to submit an 
early warning report to the BMWFW as soon as 
certain financial indicators point to a tight li-
quidity situation for the university. From 2014 
to 2016 this necessity arose only once, namely 
for the University of Salzburg in the fiscal year 
of 2015. Owing to the actions taken, the univer-
sity was, in consequence, able to achieve a bal-
anced result.

The development of the financial and eco-
nomic situation of the universities in the last 
two years of the performance agreement peri-
od 2013–2015 was satisfying. Within the perfor-
mance agreement period 2013–2015 the bal-
ance sheet total rose by 13%, the fixed assets 
also further increased. The “capital” (equity 
plus reserves and investment subsidies) also 
experienced a positive development, increas-
ing to a total sum of around €1 billion for all 
universities by the end of the performance 
agreement period. All universities put together 
generated a net profit of around €178 million 
over the entire performance agreement peri-
od.

For the fiscal year of 2016 there has been an 
increase in the universities’ fixed assets, and 
two thirds of the universities were able to 
maintain or even increase their financial sub-
stance. The overall liquidity situation can be 
regarded sufficient – nearly all universities 
were able to cover their short-term liabilities by 
the balance sheet date 2016 by current assets. 
The financial situation of the public universities 
remained stable in 2016. On the whole, the uni-
versities have a good equity base of about 
43%. The profit situation has improved signifi-
cantly as compared to the previous year. The 
“operating performance“ (sum total of reve-
nues, changes in inventory, own work capital-
ised and other operating income) has increased 
by 2% as compared to the previous year. In 
contrast, the sum total of all operating expens-
es has only risen by about 1% (including an in-
crease of 3% for personnel expenses).

The role of private sources for the funding of 
universities
International comparisons show that in Austria 
private sources play only a small role in the 
funding of universities and of tertiary educa-
tion in general. In Austria only 0.1% of GDP ex-
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penses for tertiary educational institutions 
come from private sources (OECD average: 
0.5%, EU average: 0,3%). Whilst in OECD coun-
tries on average 30% of the expenses for ter-
tiary educational institutions are privately 
funded, and 22% on average in EU member 
states, the proportion in Austria is only 6%.

The revenue structure of Austrian universi-
ties substantiates the dominance of public 
funds for the financing of universities. The 
global budget share (including the compensa-
tion received for the loss of tuition fees) 
amounts to 78% of the universities’ revenues; 
tuition fees and revenues from degree pro-
grammes in continuing education, i.e. reve-
nues coming from private sources, bring a re-
turn of only 1% each. Resources from private 
donors (2016: €17.3  million) represent only a 
very small proportion. Academic research is 
also mainly publicly funded; between 2014 and 
2016 around 29% of the universities’ R&D rev-
enues came from private sources (25% from 
business companies, 4% from private founda-
tions or associations etc.). 

At universities, there are many forms of 
sponsoring, including monetary donations and 
non-profit foundations, sponsorships of events 
or study information activities, and so-called 
“sponsorships for lecture halls“. Fundraising, 
i.e. raising private donations and other forms 
of sponsorship, has been professionalised over 
time by a number of universities, and is often 
combined with the strategic acquisition of en-
dowed professorships. In 2017, there were 46 
privately endowed professorships. At the be-
ginning of 2016, an extensive legislative pack-
age (“non-profit package“) entered into force, 
which includes a new law on non-profit founda-
tions and a number of corresponding adjust-
ments to tax provisions, and is aimed at mak-
ing it easier for higher education institutions to 
acquire funds from private sources.

Governance and steering
In the university sector, governance and steer-
ing has to be put into practice considering the 
tensions between regulation and the universi-
ties’ autonomy, Austria has implemented a 
tiered model for governance in the university 
sector. The respective governance and steer-
ing instruments are the Austrian National De-
velopment Plan for Public Universities (GUEP), 
the universities’ development plans and the 
performance agreements with universities, 
complemented by a reporting system for steer-
ing, monitoring and accountability. 

Austrian National Development Plan for Public 
Universities 
The BMWFW uses the GUEP as a strategic plan-
ning tool for developing higher education and 
as an instrument for transparently presenting 
its priorities and objectives for the next two 
performance agreement periods. As such, the 
GUEP has been integrated into the Austrian 
planning and steering system of higher educa-
tion. A first version of the GUEP covering the 
planning period of 2016–2021 was developed in 
2015, following a consultation process with 42 
higher education institutions. In preparation 
for the negotiations on the performance agree-
ments for the period 2019–2021 in 2018, the 
GUEP has already been revised on a rolling ba-
sis in 2017 for the new planning period 2019–
2024. The objectives and aspired developments 
in the university sector are outlined in the 
GUEP in eight objectives on system level, thus 
providing the strategic framework for activities 
and tasks to be prioritised by the universities. 
The GUEP includes key indicators for the area 
of teaching and their development, such as, for 
example, student numbers, numbers of gradu-
ates, student-teacher ratios. With the indicator 
“students who actively take examinations“ the 
GUEP also contains a parameter of the new 
model for university funding.

Development plans of universities
In 2015 a new regulation, which is defined in 
§ 13b UG, has established a specific standard 
for the universities’ development plans, which, 
for the first time, stipulates detailed specifica-
tions as to their structure and content. From 
now on, the development plan shall be pre-
pared by 31 December of the second year of 
every performance agreement period for the 
following two performance agreement periods, 
and based on rolling forecasts. Regarding the 
content and structure of the development 
plans, the universities shall be guided by the 
legal regulations concerning the content of the 
performance agreements. Furthermore, uni-
versities’ development plans now must contain 
a description of the universities’ human re-
source strategy and an outline of human re-
source development. In addition to the number 
of university professorships according to § 98 
and § 99 UG, universities’ development plans 
also have to indicate the number of ten-
ure-track positions as well as the number of 
positions for associate professors and “univer-
sity docents” (Universitätsdozentinnen und 
-dozenten), who can be appointed as university 
professors in a simplified process.
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Performance agreements with the universities 
The performance agreements for the period of 
2013–2015 were used to further develop an ef-
fective steering of the university sector, in or-
der to meet fundamental medium- and long-
term higher education policy goals in coopera-
tion with the universities. The projects and tar-
gets agreed upon were successfully 
implemented by the universities. These includ-
ed better coordinated academic profiles and a 
priorisation of teaching and research, improv-
ing the teaching capacities by means of the 
“quality package teaching“, and also measures 
aimed at gender equality and at improving mo-
bility and internationality as well as at imple-
menting the new teacher training. Further-
more, the numbers of study places were stipu-
lated in the performance agreements with 
those universities that have made use of the 
possibility to regulate access in very popular 
degree programmes. 

For the performance agreement period 
2016–2018, processes for preparing and con-
cluding the performance agreements as well as 
their structural and content-related design 
were further developed. The topics of focus 
were, among others, the further development 
and deepening of priorities and profiles in re-
search, an enhancement of quality in teaching 
with the ultimate aim of providing a study en-
vironment of reasonable quality, further im-
provements in quality assurance (auditing), a 
focus on university staffing (based on a set of 
indicators) as well as  on the fostering of young 
scientists and their career development, an in-
crease in the performance of universities with 
regard to the Horizon 2020 EU Framework Pro-
gramme for Research and Innovation, a focus 
on strategic knowledge and technology trans-
fer, and the ongoing implementation of the new 
teacher training.

Regular meetings (“Begleitgespräche”) 
twice a year between the BMWFW and the 
heads of the universities accompany and mon-
itor the implementation process of projects 
and targets agreed upon in the performance 
agreements. These meetings have proved an 
effective complementary instrument, allowing 
for suitable support of the universities’ imple-
mentation processes and for an institutional-
ised mutual exchange. A reporting on the im-
plementation of the performance agreements 
is included in the annual intellectual capital re-
port submitted by universities. According to 
the information given in the intellectual capital 
reports 2016, already 5% of the 1.440 projects 
agreed upon have been realised after the first 
year of the 2016–2018 period, the remaining 

projects still being implemented. 79% of the 
agreed target values have been reached or 
even exceeded by the universities.

For the performance agreement period 
2019–2021, the BMWFW’s key guiding princi-
ples as well as concerns and objectives are 
provided mainly by the GUEP. In the area of 
teaching the concrete contributions by the in-
dividual universities shall be agreed upon for 
each of the BMWFW’s targets of impact-orient-
ed budgeting. Among other topics, university 
staffing and career development as well as in-
tegrating digital transformation into the uni-
versities’ provision of services at all levels (in-
cluding the development of a relevant strategy 
for the university) are of central importance.

Evidence-based governance in the university 
sector
Evidence-based governance and the use of in-
dicators have become increasingly important 
for steering and funding universities. Identify-
ing and further developing suitable perfor-
mance indicators for the relevant target fields 
of higher education policy (e.g. intensifying 
study progress, improving student-teacher ra-
tios, optimising personnel structures, achiev-
ing equality objectives) together with support-
ing (reform) measures deriving from the moni-
toring of these performance indicators, remain 
to be the key challenges. Altogether, the goal is 
to implement a practicable and stringent steer-
ing model, which is based on a broad commit-
ment of the stakeholders. In order to optimise 
the necessary coordination between the BMW-
FW and the universities, the permanent work-
ing group OEPIGuni (Österreichische perma-
nente Indikatoren-AG Universitäten) was es-
tablished in May 2016 as a joint operating plat-
form.

Current reform projects such as the imple-
mentation of a capacity-oriented, student-
based funding of universities, will require the 
development and testing of additional forms of 
intervention aiming at reducing the number of 
dropouts and improving study progress, e.g. 
early warning systems, incentives (“nudging”), 
learning analytics, student monitoring and 
tracking of graduates’ career paths – thus, an-
alytical methods in terms of Big Data, that con-
tribute significantly to strengthening the steer-
ing and management possibilities of the federal 
government and the universities. 

Further developing the intellectual capital 
report 
The intellectual capital report is the universi-
ties’ key instrument for reporting, communica-
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tion and giving account. It serves the purpose 
of presenting the intellectual capital, the core 
processes and the output in teaching and re-
search/advancement and appreciation of the 
arts, and is thus an essential source of infor-
mation. Its further development shall ensure 
that this instrument meets the current require-
ments. In 2016 a revised Decree on Intellectual 
Capital Reports (WBV 2016) entered into force. 
It renamed the sections which the intellectual 
capital report must contain, included a revision 
of the topics of the “performance report“ and 
provided the opportunity to publish the entire 
performance report focusing only on the first 
year of the performance agreement period. It 
also introduced two new indicators (indicator 
“representation of women in the appointment 
procedures for university professors“ and indi-
cator  “professors and equivalents“), and fur-
ther modified eleven indicators. Currently, uni-
versities must submit information on a total of 
24 indicators. Medical universities and the Jo-
hannes Kepler University Linz must submit four 
additional specific indicators on the medical 
sector.
In 2017 the WBV 2016 was amended, particu-
larly taking into consideration the changes to 
the Education Documentation Regulation for 
Universities (BiDokVUni), which also had an ef-
fect on the intellectual capital report indica-
tors.

3 Staffing, promoting young scientists, 
and academic careers

Personnel planning, recruitment and human 
resources development are the basis for en-
suring and developing the quality of teaching, 
research, and organisation at universities. 
During the last years, the universities have en-
hanced and further professionalised their hu-
man resources development, improved their 
quality assurance mechanisms regarding staff-
ing decisions, and institutionalised the mecha-
nisms for planning their personnel structures. 
The universities face the requirement of imple-
menting a personnel structure, which is at the 
same time efficient and fundable with the re-
sources available, which is gender-balanced, 
but also meets intergenerational needs, giving 
future generations of junior scientists a sport-
ing chance of employment in the academic 
staff.

With the 2015 amendment of the Universi-
ties Act (UG), the Federal Ministry of Science, 
Research and Economy (BMWFW) has taken 
important steps to provide a legal framework 
which will increase the attractiveness for an 

academic career at the public universities. En-
hanced organisational conditions will improve 
the career paths for young scientists. The new 
regulations in § 99 UG allow for a continuous 
career path (tenure track) and strengthen par-
ticipation of highly qualified scientific staff. 
They enable to realise the respective measure 
stipulated in the Research, Technology and In-
novation Strategy (FTI-Strategie 2011) as well 
as in the BMWFW’s Action Plan for a Competi-
tive Research Area (2015), increasing the at-
tractiveness of Austria as a science and re-
search location.

The career models implemented by the uni-
versities are competitive and performance-ori-
ented. New provisions in the UG stipulate qual-
ity standards for the selection procedure to en-
sure the quality of tenure-track positions and 
career paths. The universities are requested to 
complete all tender and selection procedures 
for tenure track positions according to interna-
tional standards, the challenge being to find a 
balance between a strategic in-house human 
resources development and a competitive in-
ternational recruiting process.

For fostering young scientists, the universi-
ties have further developed their offerings and 
supporting measures during the last years. A 
focus was put on enhancing the quality of doc-
toral training, which many universities com-
bined with an expansion towards structured 
doctoral programmes. The BMWFW provided 
an additional incentive with its financial sup-
port of structured doctoral programmes by 
means of Higher Education Area Structural 
Funds (HRSM) applying strictly defined quality 
criteria.

The 2015 Action Plan for a Competitive Re-
search Area addresses key areas of activity in 
the field of human resources at universities, in 
particular career prospects, tenure-track posi-
tions, and the high proportion of third-party 
funded employees and fixed-term contracts. 
The performance agreements 2016–2018 with 
the universities place a focus on personnel 
structure and staffing policy as issues of cru-
cial importance. On the basis of an indica-
tor-based analysis, university-specific targets 
in personnel structure to be reached by 2018 
were agreed upon with the public universities. 
Measures on expanding highly qualified scien-
tific personnel shall contribute in particular to 
improving student-teacher ratios and the qual-
ity of support. During the forthcoming perfor-
mance agreement period, a main focus of 
steering will continue to be on human resourc-
es. At the end of the day, the success of the 
measures taken in the human resources area 
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as well as in the field of personnel development 
and fostering of young scientists will be visible 
and measurable by the performance of univer-
sities and their teaching and research.

Legal framework
Since the UG 2002 entered into force, the uni-
versities themselves are employers and thus 
entitled to the recruiting and employment of 
staff according to the Salaried Employees Act 
(Angestelltengesetz). The legal framework of 
applicable regulations is a heterogeneous one: 
On the one hand, there is the collective bar-
gaining agreement applicable to the universi-
ties’ employees (for those who entered into 
employment after 1 January 2004), and on the 
other hand, there is the civil service and salary 
legislation (Dienst- und Besoldungsrecht) (for 
civil servants as well as for government con-
tractual employees transferred to university 
employment). To date, the staff of the Danube 
University Krems is not subject to any collec-
tive bargaining agreement. At the end of 2016, 
more than three quarters (77%) of the employ-
ment contracts were based on the collective 
bargaining agreement. Less than a quarter are 
employment contracts that have been in place 
before the collective bargaining agreement en-
tered into force.

Since 2014, a series of amendments con-
cerning regulations on university staff in the 
UG came into force, in particular, new regula-
tions on career paths, on fixed-term contracts, 
on Corporate Collective Insurance (betriebliche 
Kollektivversicherung) and (paid) leave for 
teaching activities as a university professor. 
Concerning the collective bargaining agree-
ment, three addenda were made with a view to 
salary agreements.

Employees’ council agreements according to 
the Hospital Working Hours Act
Scientific and artistic university staff are sub-
ject to the provisions made in § 110 UG for the 
hours of work. Scientific staff which is subject 
to the Hospital Working Hours Act (KA-AZG) is 
excluded from these provisions. In accordance 
with EU legislation, the maximum hours of 
work specified in the KA-AZG were reduced as 
of 1 January 2015: The maximum weekly work-
ing time within a reference period of 17 weeks 
was reduced from 60 hours to 48 hours. The 
maximum permissible number of extended 
hours of duty was reduced from 32 to 25 hours. 
Provided that appropriate employees’ council 
agreements (Betriebsvereinbarungen) have 
been concluded, the maximum weekly working 
time of 60 hours may be maintained during the 

interim phase ending on 30 June 2021. As part 
of the implementation of the new arrange-
ments for the hours of work of physicians, the 
medical universities of Vienna, Graz and Inns-
bruck concluded employees’ council agree-
ments, under which salary increases for uni-
versity employees working as physicians were 
agreed upon. Within the framework of the “opt-
out“ permitted by EU law, § 110 UG now pro-
vides the legal basis for an average weekly 
working time of up to 60  hours to be deter-
mined under specific conditions for scientific 
staff which is subject to the KA-AZG.

Reformation of career structures at 
universities
Career-inhibiting structures might have a neg-
ative impact on Austria as a research and sci-
ence location. Due to the provisions for the ap-
pointment of university professors in § 98 UG, 
young scientists had, until recently, no pros-
pects of a continuous career up to a full profes-
sorship at their universities. The career path 
provided for in the Collective Bargaining Agree-
ment ended at being permanently employed as 
“associate professor“ pursuant to § 27 of the 
Collective Bargaining Agreement for University 
Staff (KV), without being a professorial mem-
ber of the academic staff.

The 2015 UG amendment established new 
legal regulations for more continuous career 
paths. § 99 para. 4 UG now provides for the le-
gal possibility to appoint “university docents” 
and associate professors as university profes-
sors in a simplified procedure, thereby opening 
a career path for those members of the 
non-professorial staff (“Mittelbau“), who, with 
the exception of an appointment according to 
§ 98 UG or § 99 para. 1 UG, had no further ca-
reer possibilities. In the case of appointment, 
the simplified appointment procedure leads to 
the conclusion of an employment contract with 
the university professor as laid down in §  25 
KV. Many universities have already specified 
the terms for a simplified procedure in their 
statutes, while at the end of 2017 others are 
still engaged in the process of implementation 
and discussion. 

With the introduction of new regulations in 
§ 99 paras. 5 and 6 UG, the law now, for the 
first time, presents a form of a tenure-track 
model, and thus a continuous career perspec-
tive from selection process to professorial 
membership. According to § 99 para. 5, the of-
fer of concluding a qualification agreement re-
quires a selection procedure that conforms to 
international, competitive standards, in par-
ticular the international advertisement of the 
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post. Pursuant to § 99 para. 6 UG, those per-
sons, who have successfully gone through the 
selection procedure pursuant to § 99 para. 5, 
who concluded a qualification agreement after 
1 October 2016 and successfully met their qual-
ification goals, shall be members of the profes-
sorial staff – without any further appointment 
procedure. According to organisational law, 
they are deemed to be university professors. 
Most universities have reacted positively to 
this model. In the large majority of cases, its 
implementation takes place by way of adapting 
current guidelines of the rectorate, to a lesser 
extent by way of adapting employees’ council 
agreements.

Staff and human resources development in 
the performance agreements
The performance agreement period 2013–2015 
was used by the universities to optimise the 
working conditions of their employees by way 
of implementing further measures for an en-
hanced work-life balance, for improved com-
patibility of career and family, as well as for 
occupational health care. Universities expand-
ed offerings in the fields of human resources 
development and continuing education (lead-
ership development, coaching, mentoring, de-
velopment of skills for “internationalisation“). 
Target values agreed upon in performance 
agreements often related to an increase in 
professorships and permanent positions, also 
in the context of improving the student-teach-
er ratios. 

For the performance agreement period 
2016–2018, projects aiming at enhancing the 
work-life balance, especially for employees 
with care commitments, as well as projects to 
expand occupational health care schemes are 
of central importance. Another focus is laid on 
measures for a human resources development 
suiting the different target groups, and further 
training of the scientific, artistic and adminis-
trative staff (leadership development, training 
and continuing education in didactics, skills in 
entrepreneurship, language skills). Fostering 
young scientists remains a central area of ac-
tivity (supporting their career development, 
coaching and mentoring, providing support by 
special services or by specific funding pro-
grammes, by mobility funding, grants or start-
up financing).

During the performance agreement period 
of 2016–2018 the BMWFW clearly focuses on 
the universities’ planning of personnel struc-
tures and has agreed on relevant projects or 
targets with all universities. The relevant top-
ics for steering are derived from the higher ed-

ucation policy objectives, which have been de-
fined in the ministry’s impact-oriented budget-
ing objectives as well as in the RTI  strategy 
and in the ministry’s action plan for research. 
They cover issues such as gender balance, 
continuous career paths for young scientists 
(tenure track) as well as enhanced stu-
dent-teacher ratios. The personnel structure 
targets are planned in dialogue with the uni-
versities concerned and are based on an “ob-
ligatory” set of indicators, which complements 
the performance agreements and consists of 
five indicators: proportion of women profes-
sors, proportion of women in tenure-track po-
sitions, percentage of professors and equiva-
lents among the scientific staff, percentage of 
tenure-track positions, percentage of adminis-
trative staff. Moreover, further targets con-
cerning the personnel structure were agreed 
upon with single universities, (e.g. targets for 
the ratio of third-party funded staff/staff fund-
ed from the global budget, or to the ratio of 
fixed-term contracts/permanent contracts).

Quantitative development of university staff
In the winter semester 2016 a total of 56,600 
people were employed at public universities, 
that is an increase of about 2,600 employees 
(4.8%) over the reporting period, i.e. in com-
parison to winter semester 2013. 48% are 
women. The academic university staff saw a 
higher increase (5.1%) than the non-academic 
university staff (3.8%). The proportion of wom-
en in the academic staff rose from 39.5% (2013) 
to 40.5%. Owing to the considerable propor-
tion of assignments that require less working 
hours than a full-time employment (e.g. lectur-
ers, student staff), the number of persons 
(56,600 headcount) covers a staff capacity of 
only 35,700 full-time equivalents (FTE). This 
number has increased during the reporting pe-
riod by 1,164 FTE (3.4%). The academic staff’s 
capacities were increased more (690 FTE) 
compared to the non-academic staff (475 FTE). 
In both areas the rise is mainly due to an in-
crease in the number of women. 

Concerning the positions of university pro-
fessors (§ 98 and § 99), since the winter se-
mester 2013 the staff capacity has risen by 
5.5% (124.4 FTE), whereas the number of peo-
ple increased by 5.9% to 2,494. Professorships 
pursuant to § 99 have seen disproportionately 
large growth (+20.6%). The proportion of wom-
en in §  98 professorships (22.5%) is signifi-
cantly below the proportion of women em-
ployed as professors under limited-term con-
tracts pursuant to §  99 (31.6%). Raising the 
proportion of women as professors (§ 98 and 
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§  99) is an objective in the impact-oriented 
budgeting of the ministry, aiming at providing 
equal opportunities, and also a key target for 
the relevant personnel structure indicators. 

The age structure among the university 
professors has shifted further towards the 
younger age groups, due to the numerous new 
appointments since 2013 – 27% of the profes-
sors active at the end of 2016 were appointed 
during these three years. 53% of the overall 
667 newly appointed professors come from 
abroad, mainly from EU member countries, 
among which 66% are from Germany.

The number of tenure-track positions, i.e. 
assistant professorships and associate profes-
sorships, has increased by 46% to 1,378 (626 
assistant professorships and 752 associate 
professorships). Due to the 2017 amendment of 
the Education Documentation Regulation for 
Universities (BidokVUni), also persons who are 
employed in a position with the prospect of 
concluding a qualification agreement will be 
statistically identified in the future. The num-
ber of tenure-track positions has increased, 
whereas at the same time the number of (ex-
piring) positions of “university docents” (Uni-
versitätsdozentinnen und -dozenten) has de-
clined. 

In the broad group of scientific and artistic 
adjunct personnel (university assistants, sen-
ior scientists/artists, senior lecturers etc.), the 
number of employees has risen by 6.2% (FTE 
+5.5%). The developments vary according to 
the employment: Whilst the number of scientif-
ic staff in expiring employments declined by 
10%, the number of university assistants was 
increased by 7.3%, of senior lecturers by 22.8% 
and of senior scientists/artists even by 33.7%. 

The number of lecturers (headcounts) has 
increased by 3.1% to 10,061, the personnel ca-
pacity having declined though, being at 1,390 
FTE by the end of 2016. In the winter semester 
2016, also 6,011 student staff members (+4%) 
were employed at the universities, covering 
personnel capacities of 1,173 FTE.

The staff funded by R&D-revenues pursuant 
to § 26 and § 27 UG has increased its numbers 
since 2013 by another 5% up to 11,600 per-
sons. The group of the third-party funded sci-
entific and artistic staff has risen by 6%, more 
than the scientific and artistic staff in total 
(+5%). The personnel capacity of third-party 
funded staff has grown by 1.2% to 7,729 FTE 
(2016). The importance of personnel capacity 
funded by R&D-revenues among the scientific 
staff is especially high at technical universities.

The majority of employment contracts at 
universities (63%) are concluded for a fixed pe-

riod of time, especially in scientific-artistic staff 
groups (78%). As a rule, employment contracts 
for training positions (e.g. positions for univer-
sity assistants, physicians in training), are con-
cluded for a fixed period of time, just as the 
employment contracts of student staff.

Student–teacher ratio
For the winter semester 2016, statistics showed 
an average 117.9 students in relation to one 
professor (2013: 121.0) and 20.6 students in re-
lation to one full-time equivalent of teaching 
staff (2013: 20.8) at public universities. Both 
ratios have improved compared to 2013, owing 
to the increase in university staff.

If statistical calculations take into account 
only “students actively taking examinations“ 
(i.e. students taking examinations amounting 
to at least 8 semester hours or 16 ECTS per 
year), there was an average of 13.3 students 
actively taking examinations per full-time 
equivalent of teaching staff in the academic 
year 2015/16, and an average of 76.0 students 
actively taking examinations per professor-
ship. These student-teacher ratios have re-
mained stable since 2012/13.

Another and more broadly defined ratio was 
developed in the context of the capacity-ori-
ented, student-based funding model for uni-
versities, comparing the number of professors 
and equivalents to the number of students ac-
tively taking examinations, also on the level of 
fields of education. In the academic year 
2015/16, there was an average of 42.5 students 
actively taking examinations in a bachelor, di-
ploma or master degree programme per pro-
fessorship or equivalent position; this ratio has 
also remained unchanged. The field of “social 
sciences, economics and law“ continues to be 
the (ISCED-)field of education with the highest 
number of students per full-time equivalent. 

Fostering of young scientists
Universities consider fostering young scientists 
a fundamental strategic objective and put in-
creasing emphasis on it when developing their 
institutional profiles. The universities strive to 
offer attractive working conditions and career 
perspectives to young scientists, especially by 
way of tenure-track positions and qualification 
agreements. The universities have implement-
ed career models with a focus on perfor-
mance-orientation and competitiveness. Uni-
versities have defined the ratio and number of 
tenure-track positions in the context of the in-
ternal planning of personnel structures, the 
aim being an adequate proportion between 
tenure track positions allowing for professional 
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qualification on the one hand and flexible fixed-
term positions for young scientists on the other 
hand. It is important to ensure that there are 
enough career opportunities for excellent 
young scientists as well as leaving room for 
“mobility“ (by way of fixed-term positions) in 
view of intergenerational justice. 

Universities offer a large number of sup-
porting measures, ranging from continuing ed-
ucation, coaching and mentoring to doctoral 
scholarships or grants and the promotion of 
mobility, as well as start-up financing for junior 
researchers. Their offerings regarding human 
resources development, continuing education 
and development of skills for teaching and re-
search are tailored to meet the needs of young 
scientists and junior researchers. Such training 
and further education programmes help to gain 
qualifications and key competences, which also 
will be of value in the case of inter-sectoral mo-
bility or when switching to a non-university ca-
reer. During the last years, universities in par-
ticular have expanded their support for acquir-
ing entrepreneurial skills. Most of the universi-
ties offer training programmes on didactic 
methods for their junior scientific staff. In or-
der to reduce the loss of qualified women over 
the course of academic careers, many univer-
sities especially support young female scien-
tists in pursuing their careers. Universities use 
the revenues of third-party funded research 
projects to increase employment opportunities 
for doctoral students and post-docs at the uni-
versity. By shaping the curriculum and the or-
ganisational design of doctoral studies and by 
fostering group-oriented doctoral training 
(doctoral programmes, doctoral schools, grad-
uate schools, doctoral academies), the univer-
sities influence the quality of the training of 
junior researchers. 

The universities’ support measures are 
complemented by scholarship programmes 
and grants offered by the BMWFW (grants for 
outgoing as well as incoming researchers), the 
Austrian Science Fund (FWF) and the Austrian 
Academy of Sciences (ÖAW), as well as by the 
mobility programmes within the framework of 
European funding programmes or international 
university networks.

On the basis of several different pro-
grammes, the Austrian Science Fund awards 
individual grants and special prizes and awards 
to junior researchers. Within its programmes 
for funding and promoting research, the FWF 
employs predoctoral and postdoctoral re-
searchers, thus making a significant contribu-
tion to the fostering of young scientists and 
junior researchers. Working in FWF projects 

offers the doctoral students an environment, 
which significantly supports the start of a suc-
cessful scientific career. By 31 December 2016 
a total of 1,759 predoctoral and 1,077 postdoc-
toral researchers funded by FWF were em-
ployed at the universities.

In 2016 a new supporting model, doc.funds, 
was developed to promote excellent structured 
doctoral programmes at Austrian research in-
stitutions entitled to award doctoral degrees. 
Doc.funds is based on a modified division of re-
sponsibility between the research institution 
and FWF: It is the research institution’s task to 
design and take responsibility of the doctoral 
programme throughout its duration, while the 
FWF provides supplementary funding for ambi-
tious and coherent research as well as quality 
assurance. In the autumn of 2016, the first call 
for applications for the new programme was 
started. The target group of doc.funds are out-
standing doctoral programmes existing at least 
two years at research institutions that are en-
titled to award doctoral degrees.

The Austrian Academy of Sciences supports 
qualified young scientists by awarding fellow-
ships for doctoral theses by the following pro-
grammes: DOC, DOC-team (for studies in arts 
and humanities as well as social sciences) and 
the Post-Doc-Track programme. 

Doctoral training
So far, it was only possible for PhD awarding 
doctoral programmes that the curriculum may 
prescribe qualitative requirements for the ad-
mission. With the 2017 UG amendment, these 
regulations were extended and now apply to all 
doctoral degree programmes. 

Following an all-time high of 30,000 stu-
dents in the winter semester 2009, the number 
of doctoral students has gradually gone down. 
The decline can be associated with the transi-
tion to three-year doctoral degree pro-
grammes. This trend has continued during the 
reporting period. In the winter semester 2016 
25,503 students (among them 46% women) 
were enrolled in a doctoral degree programme, 
8% less than in the winter semester 2013. 

According to the 2015 Social Survey of Stu-
dents (Studierenden-Sozialerhebung 2015), 
83% of the doctoral students in Austria are 
working. 30% of the doctoral students write 
their thesis  in the context of their work, 6% 
are employed solely for the purpose of writing 
a thesis. In general, employment contracts for 
doctoral students are seen as an important pil-
lar of doctoral training. The institutional in-
volvement and networking opportunities asso-
ciated with employment are considered a qual-
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ity factor and beneficial for the advancement of 
the career. Thus, structured doctoral pro-
grammes, which allow for a temporary employ-
ment at the university, are regarded to be of 
great value. According to the intellectual capi-
tal reports, in 2016 a total of 7,926 doctoral 
students had an employment contract with the 
university, that is 6% more than in 2013. 47% 
were employed as third-party funded project 
staff.

Since the transition from two- to three-year 
doctoral degree programmes, the BMWFW has 
aimed at a further qualitative development 
which is geared towards quality criteria of 
structured doctoral programmes – e.g. inte-
gration into the universities’ research activi-
ties, active mentoring and adequate supervi-
sion, doctoral thesis agreement, independent 
research of high quality, adequate organisa-
tional structures. The “Recommendations of 
the Higher Education Conference on the fur-
ther qualitative development of doctoral train-
ing in Austria” (Empfehlungen der Hochschul-
konferenz zur qualitativen Weiterentwicklung 
der Doktoratsausbildung in Österreich) and the 
“Universities Austria Position Paper on Doctor-
al Studies“ (Positionspapier der Österreichi-
schen Universitätenkonferenz zum Doktorat) 
published in 2015, were important impulses.

During the reporting period the BMWFW has 
promoted the further development in accord-
ance with these recommendations to provide 
targeted support for structured doctoral pro-
grammes. On the one hand, when concluding 
the performance agreements 2016–2018 with 
the universities, a focus was put on a qualita-
tive development towards structured doctoral 
programmes. On the other hand, Higher Edu-
cation Area Structural Funds amounting to 
€30 million were provided for the period 2016–
2018 to stimulate structured doctoral pro-
grammes. The funds are allocated on the basis 
of the indicator “doctoral students in struc-
tured doctoral programmes employed for at 
least 30 weekly hours“.

For the future, it is planned to promote a 
stronger cooperation with universities of ap-
plied sciences, the universities keeping the 
right to award the doctoral degrees, whereas 
both institutions may be jointly responsible for 
the supervision of the students.

Postdocs in academic careers
Neither the UG 2002 nor the collective bargain-
ing agreement provides for legal regulations 
especially for postdoctoral employees at uni-
versities. The denomination “postdoc“ de-
scribes scientific-artistic employees who have 

completed their doctoral training and are em-
ployed in various staff categories or job groups. 

By the end of 2016 6,193 postdocs were em-
ployed at Austrian universities, that is 13.7% 
more than in 2013. The number of postdocs has 
grown more than the overall scientific or aca-
demic staff. 59% of all postdocs were funded 
by global budget funds, 41% by third-party 
funds. The proportion of postdocs has in-
creased in all relevant staff categories and at 
present represents one third of all relevant 
employment contracts. The highest propor-
tions are found among the staff categories “as-
sistant professors“ (77%) and “senior scien-
tists/artists“ (66%). Among university assis-
tants and senior lecturers, nearly one third are 
post-docs; among third-party funded employ-
ees it is 28%.

The 39% foreign post-docs come from 88 
countries, Germany being the dominating 
country of origin. 34.4% of the postdocs with a 
foreign citizenship are from Germany. Foreign 
postdocs are mainly employed as third-party 
funded project staff (60%).

The majority of employment contracts at 
postdoc level (67.5%) are concluded for a fixed 
period of time, especially because fixed-term 
employment is the rule in the dominating staff 
categories (university assistants, third-party 
funded project staff). The data indicates that in 
certain job groups, a postdoc position increas-
es the chances for permanent employment. 

48% of the postdocs employed in the winter 
semester 2010 for a fixed period of time have 
left the university by 2016, and also 18% of the 
post-docs with permanent contracts have left. 
Third-party funded postdoc employment does 
not necessarily end with the postdoc leaving 
the university sector: 17% of the third-party 
funded postdocs of the winter semester 2010 
were employed by a university on a permanent 
basis in 2016. However, employment as a mem-
ber of the (global-budget funded) academic 
staff will promote a postdoc’s career path far 
more.

By defining prerequisites for offering a qual-
ification agreement and by establishing qualifi-
cation targets to be achieved, the universities 
determine the criteria for an academic career 
at their institution. The guidelines for qualifica-
tion agreements that were in force in 2017 
demonstrate that, as a rule, the completion of 
a doctoral or PhD degree programme is an ex-
plicit prerequisite for the conclusion of a quali-
fication agreement. Further prerequisites are 
teaching experience, relevant scientific publi-
cations as well as – depending on the universi-
ty – experience in research cooperation, acqui-
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sition of third-party funds or (international) 
working experience.

The qualification agreements’ aim is always 
to develop an individual research and teaching 
profile. Ten universities (according to their em-
ployees’ council agreements or guidelines) ex-
plicitly request habilitation as a target of qual-
ification. The other universities have mostly 
defined target criteria similar to achieving ha-
bilitation. They often demand qualification 
goals, such as involvement in management and 
administration, further and continuing educa-
tion, research stays abroad or proven external 
experience, as well as acquisition of third-par-
ty funds and development of a research group. 
At universities of arts, qualification agreements 
have so far been of minor significance, since 
universities of arts predominantly appoint in-
ternational artists and persons with external 
artistic experience.

Tenure-track positions are a “classical“ in-
strument for promoting a university career. 
Due to the growing number of postdocs, how-
ever, the universities are experiencing an in-
creasingly critical bottleneck. A sufficient num-
ber of attractive postdoc positions is seen as 
an important measure to counteract this devel-
opment and thus, the BMWFW put a focus on 
this issue for the performance agreement peri-
od 2016–2018.

4 Research at universities

The more a country’s economy is operating at 
the boundaries of technology, the more signifi-
cant basic research will be for its innovation 
system. Austria is well on its way to become 
one of the leading knowledge economies, the 
principal actors in the field of basic research 
being the universities, which play a key role in 
two respects: Firstly, guided by the paradigm 
of research-based teaching, they train young 
scientists and provide highly qualified staff for 
the different areas of the country’s innovation 
system. Secondly, they generate scientific find-
ings, which as a public good are taken up by 
companies, further developed to new products, 
and commercially exploited. Both factors – ac-
cess to highly qualified research staff as well as 
to scientific knowledge and new developments 
in research – are especially important criteria 
for location decisions of R&D-intensive compa-
nies. 

Universities are competing against each 
other – at a national and international level – 
for students, researchers, reputation, and vis-
ibility. This competition is based, not least, on 
their performance in research, especially on 

outstanding performance in basic research. In 
spite of a tight federal budget, it was possible 
to further increase the universities’ basic 
budget, thus ensuring basic funding for univer-
sity research. Furthermore, competitive fund-
ing by way of research funding programmes 
was enhanced, especially by funding pro-
grammes aiming at cooperations between uni-
versities, other research institutions and com-
panies. The increase in third-party revenues 
demonstrates that universities are effectively 
participating. Having established targeted sup-
porting structures, the universities also suc-
cessfully raise EU funds, especially within the 
scope of the Horizon 2020 programme.

At the same time, the public funds for re-
search infrastructures were increased, the uni-
versities getting targeted support for major re-
search infrastructural projects. The research 
infrastructure database of the BMWFW was en-
hanced and opened for non-university collabo-
rations. All of these measures aim to improve 
the research performance of Austrian universi-
ties.

In recent years, competition and societal 
challenges have contributed to universities 
generally opening up. Open Access was strong-
ly encouraged and promoted by various initia-
tives. Especially in research, collaborations 
have become indispensable with regard to 
knowledge transfer, at an international as well 
as at a national and regional level. That is why, 
for the past two performance agreement peri-
ods, the BMWFW has put an emphasis on im-
proving the universities’ profiles based on their 
strengths in research. The aim is to “build on 
one’s strengths”, in order to achieve or expand 
critical mass in selected fields of research, thus 
further enhancing the performance in research 
and the visibility of institutions and excellent 
researchers. In some fields, for example in 
quantum physics, Austria has already system-
atically achieved excellence; international visi-
bility and scientific reputation obtained give 
evidence of the success. The aim now must be 
that universities achieve similar success in oth-
er research fields as well, by exploiting the po-
tentials of digitalisation and in order to meet 
the Grand Challenges of our society effectively.

Research staff in Austria
According to the R&D survey, there were 41,960 
persons equalling 15,226 FTE engaged in re-
search and development at public universities 
– that is an increase by 6% in persons and 4% 
in FTE as compared to 2013, the majority being 
part of the scientific staff. Depending on their 
employment contract and their scope of duties, 
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the different groups of the scientific staff dedi-
cate a different amount of their working time to 
tasks in R&D, e.g. professors about 53%.

Research funding at universities
Public funds (89.4% of the total research ex-
penditures at universities in Austria) continue 
to play the most important role in funding re-
search at Austrian universities, especially fed-
eral government funding. In 2015, the R&D ex-
penditures funded by the federal government 
totalled €1.62 billion (75.2%). 4.8% (€104 mil-
lion) was funded by the business enterprise 
sector, 0.7% by the private non-profit sector, 
3.3% (€71 million) by the EU, and 1.8% came 
from other sources abroad. Amongst public 
funding sources, the funding resources from 
the Austrian Science Fund (FWF) and the Aus-
trian Research Promotion Agency (FFG), which 
represent a total share of 12.5%, are of signifi-
cant importance.

In line with the system, most of the funds 
for basic research go to the universities. In 
2015, these funds amounted to €1.16 billion 
(incl. university clinics) – thus, 63% of all basic 
research in Austria is carried out at the univer-
sities. Austrian universities also have a strong 
presence in the field of applied research. In 
2015 €787.9  million in research funds were 
spent for applied research at universities, that 
is 21.7% of the overall funds for applied re-
search in Austria. Research of this kind is car-
ried out in particular in collaboration with the 
industry and in technical fields, while basic re-
search is essential especially for resource-in-
tensive sciences like natural sciences, human 
medicine and health sciences, as well as for 
humanities and social sciences.

At universities, third-party funded research 
plays an increasingly important role. Competi-
tion for research funding has intensified, the 
effort in the acquisition process for third-party 
funds has increased. The third-party revenues 
of the universities from R&D projects have ris-
en once again during the 2014–2016 period and 
have reached their peak of €670 million in 2016. 
Accordingly, annual third-party revenues have 
risen by an average of 3.9% since 2013, also 
because performance in third-party funding is 
a fixed issue in performance agreements. The 
origins of university third-party funds for re-
search are heterogeneous. Within the period 
2014–2016 companies were the key providers 
of funds for third-party funded research pro-
jects, with an accumulated total of €482.6 mil-
lion, thus funding 24.6% of the universities’ re-
search revenues. The main sources of public 
third-party funding were the FWF (€477.4 mil-

lion, 24.3% of all funds), the EU (12.7%) and 
the FFG (9.7%). From 2014 to 2016, the FWF’s 
share has slightly declined in nominal terms, 
while EU funds have slightly increased, and 
FFG funds even strongly increased. These four 
sources cover nearly three quarters of the 
overall third-party research revenues of the 
universities.

The FWF is especially important for funding 
basic research. In the period 2014–2016 86.6% 
of the newly approved FWF grants (€491.6 mil-
lion) were distributed to universities. The total 
amount of funds granted to each university 
varied, depending on the size and specialisa-
tion of the universities. Technical and medical 
universities have proven to be particularly suc-
cessful in gaining high sums. Furthermore, the 
Programme for Arts-based Research (PEEK) 
has been successfully evolving: From 2014–
2016, a total of €9.5 million in FWF funds was 
granted to universities of arts. In general, a 
majority of the FWF funds is invested in pro-
jects to finance the scientific staff. In 2015 the 
FWF funded a total of 3,989 persons, nearly 
half (49.6%) of which were predoctoral re-
searchers.

Grants from the FFG are of growing impor-
tance for funding research, especially in the 
context of knowledge and technology transfer. 
Within the period of 2014–2016, grants amount-
ing to a total of €179.1 million went from the 
FFG to public universities – an increase of 40% 
as compared with the 2011–2013 period. The 
shares of the single universities differ accord-
ing to their research orientation and their focus 
on applied research.

Research infrastructure
Well-developed research infrastructures es-
tablish the main basis for excellent research. 
The RTI strategy and the Austrian National Re-
search Infrastructure Action Plan (Forschungs-
infrastruktur-Aktionsplan) 2014–2020 make 
provisions for a harmonised and coordinated 
further development of research infrastruc-
tures at universities. On the basis of the 2015 
Action Plan for a Competitive Research Area 
(Aktionsplan für einen wettbewerbsfähigen 
Forschungsraum), research infrastructure co-
operations with research institutions in the 
business and industry sector were strength-
ened. In establishing a publicly accessible re-
search infrastructure database, the BMWFW 
has implemented a fundamental measure to 
enhance research infrastructure. The research 
infrastructure projects agreed upon in the per-
formance agreements promote further devel-
opment. Furthermore, in 2016, 43 cooperation 
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projects to improve R&D infrastructure facili-
ties at universities were subsidised by Higher 
Education Area Structural Funds (HRSM). 

Austria’s participation in international infra-
structures, especially within the scope of the 
ESFRI-Roadmap, is very important for devel-
oping the national academic profile as well as 
for Austria’s international competitiveness. 
Austria is currently participating in eleven ES-
FRI projects.

Research in the performance agreements
Already in the performance agreement period 
2013–2015 the universities have started to fo-
cus on key research areas in order to promote 
their academic profile and to enhance their 
competitiveness. This will be continued in the 
period 2016–2018. 

In the performance agreements of 2016–
2018 all universities have defined research pri-
orities, which become visible in their research 
performance as well as in the quality of re-
searchers. Thereby, achievements in basic re-
search as well as in knowledge and technology 
transfer are becoming increasingly important. 

Research achievements
Universities use various ways to record, to 
communicate and to measure research 
achievements and research results, which also 
differ according to the discipline. During the 
last few years, publishing research findings in 
“peer reviewed“ journals has gained consider-
able significance. In 2016 the publications in 
SCI, SSCI and A&HCI journals, amounting to 
14,416 first publications (plus 14% compared to 
2013), were among the most important types 
of publications, as well as publications in edited 
volumes (totalling 13,136 first publications). 
Especially in human medicine and natural 
sciences as well as in technical sciences, publi-
cations in peer reviewed journals are of great 
relevance, whereas in the social sciences and 
humanities also edited volumes and other sci-
entific journals play an important role. In addi-
tion to publishing, there are also other dimen-
sions used for recording and measuring re-
search output and its exploitation, such as sci-
entific lectures and presentations, patent 
applications, external research funds raised, 
academic spin-offs, the number of collabora-
tion projects with companies and the integra-
tion into research networks.

Open Access to research findings
An open access to research findings and their 
database is the foundation for a broad use of 
knowledge and scientific findings by research-

ers as well as by the general public. The uni-
versities have recognised that access to re-
search results and data offers the opportunity 
to make their research achievements more vis-
ible. Austria has made good progress in the 
fields of Open Science and Open Access. The 
Austrian copyright law was amended in 2015. 
The Open Access Network Austria (OANA) with 
its 60 members (universities, universities of 
applied sciences, FWF and research institu-
tions) has developed recommendations in or-
der to implement an Open Access publishing 
model for preferably all the publications until 
2025. Since 2008, the FWF has been practicing 
an Open Access policy which provides free ac-
cess to FWF funded publications and which 
promotes Open Access infrastructures, alter-
native Open Access models as well as Open Ac-
cess journals. Open Access has also been an 
issue in the performance agreements. 14 uni-
versities have already established an institu-
tional Open Access policy; there are currently 
18 institutional repositories operated by Austri-
an universities. The “Austrian Academic Li-
brary Consortium“ (KEMÖ) consists of 58 sci-
entific libraries in Austria. Its purpose is the 
coordinated acquisition and management of 
electronic resources and the negotiation of 
price offsetting and Read & Publish agreements 
beneficial for the price formation. By Higher 
Education Area Structural Funds, the BMWFW 
also promotes the setup of e-infrastructures 
necessary for Open Access and the transfor-
mation of all scientific publication activities to 
Open Access. 

Cooperation in research
Over the past years, the cooperation culture 
has intensified significantly, in particular in the 
field of research. Owing to their collaborations, 
Austrian universities have been able to form 
strategically important and internationally vis-
ible alliances to conduct top-quality research. 
Also the non-university research institutions 
are strong cooperation partners, which 
strengthen the alliances with collaborations ex-
ceeding research, such as Double Appoint-
ments in teaching. Many of these collabora-
tions have already been evolving successfully, 
documented by excellent research achieve-
ments, for instance the award of an ERC grant 
or a Wittgenstein-Award. It is the aim to fur-
ther reinforce the networking of research ac-
tivities, in order to better being able to respond 
to the Grand Challenges in society via net-
works and cooperation.
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5 Studies, teaching and further 
education

Quality research-oriented teaching aims at 
training students to become independent grad-
uates with a high level of expertise and social 
skill, who think in a critical and interdisciplinary 
way. A modern and innovative university edu-
cation takes into consideration the students’ 
needs and the demands of science, society and 
economy. Providing high-quality teaching  in 
spite of high student numbers, promoting in-
ter- and transdisciplinarity – which is vital for 
solving key social problems – in study pro-
grammes, and offering adequate training in 
continuing education to promote “lifelong 
learning“, those are the main challenges the 
universities are facing today.

During the last years, the universities 
strived to appropriately develop their degree 
programmes as well as their programmes in 
continuing education and to meet the high 
quality standards, which accompanied the 
change from teacher-centred learning to stu-
dent-centred learning. The universities in-
creasingly use teaching and learning methods, 
which promote the students’ independence 
and include innovative formats. Universities 
consider digital technologies to be a key issue 
for the further development of teaching and 
learning and as a basis for modern innovative 
education. During the last years, universities 
have extended their use of digital technologies 
in teaching and taken accompanying measures 
to foster teacher competence. The use of digi-
tal technologies in teaching has become com-
monplace, and it is hardly possible to imagine 
teaching without e-technologies. Over the next 
few years, universities will have to embed fur-
ther developments in this field in an overall 
strategy of the university on the use of digital 
technologies.

Since 2014, there were a number of amend-
ments to the Universities Act 2002 (UG), deal-
ing with fundamental developments in the 
fields of studying, teaching and continuing ed-
ucation. The amendment of the UG by F. L. G. 
I No 21/2015 (“2015 minor amendment“) incor-
porated provisions for teacher training pro-
grammes offered as joint programmes of uni-
versities and university colleges of teacher ed-
ucation. The next step, the 2017 UG amend-
ment on “joint study law“ (as amended by 
F. L. G. I No 129/2017), harmonised the provi-
sions of study law according to the Universities 
Act 2002 and to the Teacher Education Act 2005 
(Hochschulgesetz) completely. This allows for a 
high quality scientific as well as practically ori-

ented training of future teachers in close coop-
eration between universities and university 
colleges of teacher education. Furthermore, 
this amendment enables equal participation of 
universities of applied sciences and private 
universities in joint study programmes. These 
new regulations set the course for future 
cross-sectoral collaborations and innovative 
further developments in the field of studies, 
which were subject and result of the “Shaping 
HEIs for the Future“ project.

The “2015 major amendment“ (UG as 
amended by F. L. G. I No 131/2015) reflects the 
outcome of the mandatory evaluations of the 
studies with admission regulations and of the 
orientation period (StEOP) carried out in 2015. 
These legal measures are intended to make a 
contribution to increase the proportion of stu-
dents graduating. The adapted regulations re-
garding the StEOP aim at ensuring a successful 
start of university studies by providing the stu-
dents with an overview of the most important 
contents, giving them a realistic picture of the 
degree programme and its requirements on 
the one hand, and clarifying and establishing a 
mutual obligation between student and univer-
sity on the other hand. The positive evaluation 
of the admission regulations was the prerequi-
site and basis for its legal prolongation until 
2021. An accompanying monitoring is impor-
tant in order to guarantee transparency and 
assess the effectiveness and necessary amend-
ments, also in view of a new evaluation in 2020. 
Moreover, the continuation of the admission 
regulations forms part of a forthcoming capac-
ity-oriented, student-based funding of univer-
sities, the implementation of which must be ac-
companied by adequate possibilities to control 
the access according to the capacities. 

Students are not only consumers of higher 
education, but they actively participate in 
shaping higher education. A number of univer-
sities already builds on the participation of 
their students in the further development of 
teaching and study programmes and encour-
ages the self-responsibility of students. A sur-
vey carried out on behalf of the Council for Re-
search and Technology Development (Rat für 
Forschung und Technologieentwicklung) and 
based on the contributions of students and 
graduates, points out the students’ high ex-
pectations of future higher education (Winno-
vation Consulting 2017). The results show that 
students have high expectations regarding the 
further development of teaching in an increas-
ingly digitised environment, the promotion of 
their individual development and their being 
prepared for working life – thus pointing out 
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the areas the universities will have to focus on 
over the next few years. 

Degree programmes offered at universities
In the winter semester 2017 a total of 1,109 de-
gree programmes were offered at universities. 
Bachelor and master degree programmes ac-
count for 86% in the range of studies, 10% are 
doctoral degree programmes, only 4% diploma 
degree programmes. 

Since the winter semester 2016, teacher 
training programmes are only offered as bach-
elor and master degree programmes. Nearly 
all teacher training programmes have been de-
signed as joint programmes by universities and 
university colleges of teacher education in four 
regional clusters.

The bachelor degree programme in human 
medicine established at the University of Linz 
in 2014 was implemented corresponding to the 
development roadmap (Aufbauplan). In the ac-
ademic year 2016/17 there were study places 
for 120 new students. The preclinical training is 
carried out in cooperation with the Medical Uni-
versity of Graz. Preclinical training in Linz will 
start in the academic year 2018/19. The master 
degree programme in human medicine started 
with the academic year 2017/18.

The universities continuously adapt their 
range of degree programmes offered. Between 
2015 and 2017, in addition to the new teacher 
training programmes 17 new bachelor degree 
programmes, 60 new master degree pro-
grammes and 11 new doctoral degree pro-
grammes augmented the range of programmes 
offered. The focus was in particular on expand-
ing non-consecutive master degree pro-
grammes. Among the new degree programmes, 
there is a growing number of interdisciplinary 
studies. To comply with the Islam law 2015, the 
University of Vienna established a bachelor de-
gree programme “Islamic Theology“.

In order to internationalise their studies and 
enhance the general and subject-specific lan-
guage competences, the universities are fur-
ther expanding the range of courses and de-
gree programmes offered in English, focusing 
on master and PhD programmes. In 2016, the 
universities offered 166 degree programmes in 
English, most of them master degree pro-
grammes (119) and doctoral or PhD pro-
grammes (44). English degree programmes 
thus represent 15% of the universities range of 
studies.

According to the intellectual capital reports 
2016, five universities (The Universities of Vi-
enna, Innsbruck, Linz, Klagenfurt and the Vi-
enna University of Economics and Business Ad-

ministration) offered part-time study pro-
grammes among their degree programmes. 
Also the majority of the certificate university 
programmes for further education offered at 
the universities are part-time. Especially in 
master degree programmes, universities are 
increasingly taking into account the needs of 
working students.

Collaborations of universities in the field of 
teaching, such as “NAWI Graz”, allow for or-
ganisational and subject-related synergy ef-
fects by way of joint degree programmes or 
harmonised course offerings. In 2016 16 uni-
versities offered cooperative degree pro-
grammes; 89 degree programmes were na-
tional study cooperations (the majority coop-
erating with another Austrian university or with 
university colleges of teacher education), and 
88 degree programmes were joint, double and 
multiple degree programmes offered as inter-
national collaborations.

Implementing the new teacher training 
Starting in the academic year of 2016/17, the 
new joint teacher training programmes for sec-
ondary schools (general education) are offered 
in all four regional clusters (“Verbundregio-
nen”). Teacher training programmes are of-
fered for more than 35 subjects. Students are 
required to complete a multi-stage admission 
procedure, which includes a self-assessment 
and a test to demonstrate their aptitude for 
teaching. In 2016/17 a joint admission proce-
dure was conducted in three regional clusters 
(Southeast, Central, West), its development 
having been funded by Higher Education Area 
Structural Funds (HRSM). The regional cluster 
Northeast carried out its own procedure.

The implementation of the new teacher 
training made it necessary to clarify and har-
monise the provisions of study law in the Uni-
versities Act 2002 (UG) and the Teacher Educa-
tion Act 2005 (Hochschulgesetz). The universi-
ties, university colleges of teacher education 
and the Austrian National Union of Students 
(ÖH) were involved in the drafting of the new 
study law, which was adopted by the National 
Council in June 2017. According to new regula-
tions, joint study programmes may be offered 
at all Austrian post-secondary educational in-
stitutions on the basis of a curriculum to be en-
acted identically by the participating educa-
tional institutions, thus also allowing for the 
participation of universities of applied sciences 
and private universities.

In 2016 the Federal Ministry of Science, Re-
search and Economy (BMWFW) provided HRSM 
funds for structural and quality enhancing 
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measures in teacher training. The funding of 
additional scientific staff up to 82 FTE aims at 
enhancing subject didactics (especially in the 
MINT subjects as well as in German and Eng-
lish), focusing on fostering young scientists. 
Other cooperation projects funded by HRSM 
concern the further development of admission 
procedures for teacher training programmes, 
which are carried out at 20 universities and 
university colleges of teacher education, as 
well as a teacher training programme for “lat-
eral entrants” in the field of musical education.

To ensure the scientific character as well as 
the practical orientation of the new teacher 
training programmes, the Quality Assurance 
Council of Teacher Education (QSR) recom-
mended in 2014 establishing “working units” 
(“Arbeitseinheiten”) which include scientific 
staff as well as persons with practical experi-
ence. The universities and university colleges of 
teacher education are currently implementing 
these working units, which are staffed with per-
sonnel funded by HRSM, the Federal Ministry of 
Education (BMB) being accountable for new pro-
fessorships at university colleges of teacher ed-
ucation. The QSR supports the establishment of 
the working units on a consultative basis.

Digital media in teaching 
Media-supported teaching and digital media in 
communication and knowledge transfer are be-
coming increasingly common at universities. 
Learning platforms are used for communica-
tion purposes and the administration of studies 
and provide learning materials as well as tools 
for collaborative tasks online. During the last 
years, universities have extended the use of 
digital technologies in teaching and implement-
ed accompanying measures to develop teach-
ing competence. Especially when dealing with 
high numbers of students or a heterogeneous 
student body, digitalisation plays an important 
role in the field of teaching and learning. At 16 
universities there are special service centres 
for media-supported teaching available for uni-
versity teaching staff.

A large majority of universities have includ-
ed e-learning activities in their performance 
agreements for 2016–2018: further develop-
ments (e.g. of existing learning platforms or 
learning environments), plans to expand the IT 
infrastructure in connection with technolo-
gy-based teaching and learning, as well as new 
projects for the organisation of teaching and 
learning. Increasing e-learning in order to 
make teaching more flexible is an often dis-
cussed issue as regards students with special 
needs or working students.

Open Educational Resources (OER) are 
teaching and learning materials, which are 
made freely accessible for others to use. In co-
operation with partner institutions, the associ-
ation “Austria Forum New Media in Teaching“ 
(Forum neue Medien in der Lehre Austria) has 
developed recommendations on the integra-
tion of OER at higher education institutions in 
Austria in 2016 and in this context has also 
drawn up a concept for OER certification at 
Austrian higher education institutions. 

The BMWFW supports cooperation projects 
in the field of digital media in teaching by HRSM 
funds, i.a. the project “Open Education Aus-
tria“, which is also building up infrastructure.

The use of digital technologies in teaching 
has become commonplace, and it is hardly 
possible to imagine teaching without technolo-
gies. Over the next few years, it will be the uni-
versities’ responsibility to further develop dig-
itisation in this field based on an overall strat-
egy on the use of digital technologies.

Quality of teaching
Over the past years, “quality of teaching“ has 
become an important issue in the political dis-
course in higher education, also gaining impor-
tance as a field of action for universities. The 
Austrian Higher Education Conference (Öster-
reichische Hochschulkonferenz) has published 
recommendations in 2015 on the enhancement 
of the quality of teaching in higher education.

In the performance agreements 2016–2018 
the universities have taken due account of ini-
tiatives and measures for strengthening and 
enhancing the quality of teaching. The univer-
sities are implementing measures concerning 
the design of studies, organisation of teaching 
and learning, and for enhancing teaching com-
petences (e.g. teaching competence pro-
grammes, courses for basic qualification or 
further training in teaching, specific courses 
for e-didactics and the use of digital media in 
teaching).

Adequate student-teacher ratios are a key 
aspect of the quality of teaching. The BMWFW 
has supported the improvement of stu-
dent-teacher ratios in very popular fields of ed-
ucation by way of a “quality package teaching“ 
specified in the performance agreements 2013–
2015, which provides for 95 additional positions 
for highly qualified scientific staff. These posi-
tions were filled within the performance agree-
ment period. The funding of these positions will 
be continued in the performance agreement 
period 2016–2018.

With the aim of encouraging an intensified 
dialogue on teaching issues, the website “Atlas 
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der guten Lehre“ (an online reference of exam-
ples of good teaching practice) and a series of 
events “Dialogue on teaching in higher educa-
tion” were launched. The series of events com-
prises four events in 2017 and 2018, which are 
organised by the BMWFW in cooperation with 
the Austrian agency for international mobility 
and cooperation in education, science and re-
search (OeAD). The importance of good teach-
ing is also demonstrated by honours and prizes 
awarded to teachers by the universities and by 
the BMWFW “Ars docendi“ award. 

Teaching and studies in the performance 
agreements
In the performance agreement period 2013–
2015 the universities have implemented meas-
ures and carried out projects, which focused 
mainly on enhancing the quality of teaching 
and increasing the “studyability“ of degree 
programmes.  Universities have further devel-
oped their range of studies in a needs-based 
manner and successfully realised their projects 
for introducing new degree programmes or 
adapting existing ones. Further fields, in which 
the universities successfully implemented their 
plans, were the training and further education 
of teachers in teaching methods, an expanded 
use of new media in teaching and the imple-
mentation of the new teacher training.

The further enhancement of the quality of 
teaching will remain a central concern of the 
universities throughout the performance 
agreement period 2016–2018. Since the imple-
mentation of the Bologna structure of degree 
programmes has largely been completed, the 
focus now lies on the enhancement of quality. 
With regard to their portfolio of studies, the 
universities have planned for the period of 
2016–2018 to introduce new study programmes 
or discontinue or adapt existing degree pro-
grammes, among which some shall be further 
developed towards interdisciplinary pro-
grammes and joint or double degree pro-
grammes. The implementation of the new 
teacher training and the joint teacher training 
programmes with university colleges of teach-
er education plays a major role at all universi-
ties involved. Projects on the use of digital me-
dia and the development of new teaching and 
learning methods, as well as digitised courses 
are of central importance at most of the uni-
versities. Many universities are further ex-
panding their didactic training courses for 
teachers, some of them with additional meas-
ures including coaching or peer teaching, most 
of them with a focus on teaching technologies 
and media didactics, and also on didactics of 

examining. Specific projects aim at making the 
significance of teaching competence more visi-
ble, and at raising the status of teaching. An-
other focus is put on projects with the aim of 
providing information for potential students 
and on projects to improve the provided infor-
mation and counselling services. In order to 
provide orientation to potential students prior 
to the beginning of their studies, online self-as-
sessments are being designed and further ex-
panded, which shall support their choice of 
studies.

With regard to the international orientation 
of studies, the projects of universities focus on 
strategic objectives such as integrating mobili-
ty windows into the curricula, introducing de-
gree programmes offered in English and in-
creasing the number of courses offered in Eng-
lish.

 
Evaluation of the admission regulations
The admission regulations pursuant to § 124b 
UG (relating to degree programmes subject to 
the German numerus clausus), pursuant to 
§ 14h UG (in very popular degree programmes) 
as well as the qualitative admission require-
ments for the admission to master and PhD 
programmes (§ 64 para. 4 and 5 UG) were lim-
ited until the end of 2015 and 2016 and, by law, 
had to be evaluated.

The evaluation of the degree programmes 
with admission regulations according to § 124b 
UG (human medicine, dental medicine, other 
medical studies, veterinary studies, psycholo-
gy, the bachelor degree programmes of jour-
nalism and communication studies ruled by de-
cree in § 124b para. 6) came to the result that 
the admission regulations run smoothly and 
have been successively enhanced. They were 
found to have a positive effect on the study 
progress, the students’ satisfaction with their 
studies. and the proportion of those graduat-
ing. In human medicine the retention quota af-
ter two semesters went up to 97%, also the 
number of students who actively take exami-
nations increased. The proportion of students 
completing their studies within the standard 
period of study rose significantly at all medical 
universities, the average duration of study was 
reduced by about two semesters. 

The evaluation of the admission regulations 
pursuant to §  14h UG included an analysis of 
applicants and enrolled students according to 
their social and cultural background. Following 
the implementation of these admission regula-
tions, the number of students beginning their 
studies declined significantly by 31%. Within 
the first year of the implementation, the num-
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ber of registrations did not exceed the sum to-
tal of study places at nearly all locations (with 
the exception of pharmacology); in the case of 
admission tests, less applicants than the num-
ber of study places available took a test. In the 
second year after the implementation, the 
number of new students increased by 13% as 
compared to the previous year. The evaluation 
found that these developments were a reaction 
on the implementation of application proce-
dures in general, leading to increased reflec-
tion and commitment – and subsequently 
self-selection – in the choice of studies, but 
also to a diversion of the demand towards stud-
ies without admission regulations (“Ausweich-
studien“). The composition of applicants and 
enrolled students in terms of social and cultur-
al background has shown little change. There-
fore, the evaluation suggested a continuation 
of the admission regulations for another limit-
ed period of time and further monitoring over a 
longer observation period.

Legislative amendments
According to the 2015 amendment of the UG, 
F.  L. G. I No 131/2015, the admission regula-
tions pursuant to § 124b and § 14h UG will be 
continued in a slightly modified form until 2021, 
and the ramifications shall be newly evaluated 
by 2020. The §§ 71a to e comprise all admission 
regulations in one chapter (Chapter 3a), thus 
continuing them for the fixed period of time. 

§ 71c UG represents the follow-up provision 
for § 14h UG, also containing the degree pro-
grammes “journalism” and “communication 
studies” by now. In § 71d UG the former regu-
lations of § 124b UG have been adopted, with a 
reference to the “supplementary provisions re-
lating to admission to degree programmes 
subject to German numerus clausus“.

§ 71e UG regulated the admission to master 
and PhD degree programmes. In the 2017 UG 
amendment these provisions were included 
under §  63a UG, which now provides for the 
possibility of admission restrictions for all doc-
toral degree programmes and not, as hitherto, 
solely for PhD degree programmes.

Quota regulation in human and dental 
medicine
Since 2006 an infringement procedure of the 
European Commission was pending against 
Austria regarding the so-called “safeguard 
clause” for its medical studies (quota regula-
tion, 75% of the study places being reserved 
for applicants with a higher education entrance 
qualification acquired in Austria). On 17  Mai 
2017 the European Commission announced 

that they would lift the EU moratorium and 
close the pending infringement procedure 
against Austria. Due to this decision of the Eu-
ropean Commission, the quota regulation for 
human medicine will be maintained.

Quantitative developments in studies with 
admission regulations
In the winter semester 2016 new entrants en-
rolled for nearly 53,000 studies at public uni-
versities. 39% thereof had in place some form 
of admission regulation (degree programmes 
according to § 71d and § 71c UG, provided that 
the universities had made use of the admission 
regulations; studies in the fields of teaching, 
arts and sports requiring an aptitude test). 
35.5% of all studies that were begun in the win-
ter semester 2014 had in place admission reg-
ulations. This proportion has increased during 
the reporting period to 39%, since some more 
universities started admission procedures ac-
cording to § 71c or § 14h UG for some degree 
programmes.

Degree programmes with admission regula-
tions according to § 124b or § 71d UG: In hu-
man and dental medicine the number of appli-
cations and participants in the admission tests 
has increased successively since 2014, while in 
veterinary medicine the demand remained at 
about the same level. In psychology the num-
ber of test participants has stagnated at a high 
level (around 4,500 participants for 1,245 study 
places). The admission regulations are selec-
tive and result in an admission rate of less than 
20% in human medicine and around 25% to 
30% in the other studies. The proportion of 
German new entrants is very high compared to 
other fields of education.

Degree programmes with admission regula-
tions according to §  14h or §  71c UG: In the 
winter semester 2016, or in the academic year 
2016/17, respectively, it was possible to put 
into place admission regulations for 47 studies 
(incl. journalism) – 10 universities in 34 studies 
(incl. journalism) made use of admission pro-
cedures. The University of Natural Resources 
and Applied Life Sciences Vienna and the Vien-
na University of Technology introduced admis-
sion procedures for some studies in the winter 
semester 2016 (Food Science and Biotechnolo-
gy, Informatics). In pharmacology, journalism, 
and in economic studies (excl. one location) 
there are admission procedures for all degree 
programmes. In informatics, the University of 
Innsbruck introduced admission procedures in 
the winter semester 2014, the University of Vi-
enna and the Vienna University of Technology 
in the winter semester 2016.
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In 2016/17 the “utilisation rate”, i.e. the 
share of new entrants compared to the num-
ber of study places, was around 79% in phar-
macology, and at 62% in the field of education 
“management and administration, business 
and administration, economic sciences“; in in-
formatics, it was at 89% at locations having 
admission regulations in place, and at 87% in 
total.

In the field of education “architecture and 
town planning“ admission regulations accord-
ing to §  14h or §  71c were introduced at the 
Graz University of Technology and the Univer-
sity of Innsbruck. While the utilisation rate 
stands at 54% in the locations that have ad-
mission regulations in place, it amounts to 
nearly 90% in total. These numbers indicate 
the reluctance of new entrants to take part in 
an admission procedure.

In the field of education “biology and bio-
chemistry“ admission was regulated from the 
start. At the beginning there were admission 
procedures in place at about two thirds of the 
locations, meanwhile nearly all locations have 
activated some kind of admission regulation. 
In the academic year 2016/17 only 79% of the 
study places available had been occupied, in 
“journalism and communication studies“ about 
74%.

Following the introduction of admission reg-
ulations, the number of new entrants in degree 
programmes pursuant to § 14h or § 71c had in-
itially dropped, then increased until the winter 
semester 2015 by annually 11%, and most re-
cently – between the winter semester 2015 and 
the winter semester 2016 – declined again by 
6.7%. This means that the number of study 
places offered is not fully exploited in any of 
the relevant fields of education (best in the ac-
ademic year 2016/17 in informatics with 87% 
and in pharmacology with around 79%, in eco-
nomics, however, amounting to only 62%, in 
biology to 79%).

Orientation phase
The statutory provisions regulating the orien-
tation phase (StEOP) were introduced for a lim-
ited period, until 31 December 2015. An evalu-
ation of the regulations had to be submitted by 
the end of 2015. The report on the results of 
the evaluation was submitted to the responsi-
ble committee of the National Council in June 
2015. The evaluation has also taken into con-
sideration recommendations of the Court of 
Audit, following an examination of the imple-
mentation of the StEOP at different universi-
ties. The amendment of the UG (F. L. G. I No. 
131/2015) has taken into account most of the 

evaluation results, which was acknowledged by 
the Court of Audit.

The revised provisions stipulate that the 
StEOP is to be implemented in all degree pro-
grammes with the exception of degree pro-
grammes at the universities of the arts (in 
studies according to §  71d UG an orientation 
period can be omitted if the rectorate decides 
so by decree – all universities concerned have 
done so). By taking up the respective proposal 
of the evaluation, a minimum and maximum 
scope of ECTS credit points for the StEOP was 
defined. Pursuant to the new provision, it 
therefore shall amount to a total of at least 8 
and no more than 20 ECTS credit points.

Another recommendation of the evaluation 
was to clarify whether it is possible to take 
more advanced courses prior to the successful 
completion of the STEOP. Pursuant to the new 
provision, the curriculum may permit to take 
such courses up to 22 ECTS credit points. It 
was also decided that for the StEOP examina-
tions the same regulations as for other exami-
nations shall apply regarding the number of 
repetitions of an examination.

The universities were given time until 
30 June 2017 for including the new regulations 
in the curricula. The implementation and the 
discipline-specific adaptation of the StEOP at 
each university was subject of the meetings 
with the universities accompanying the imple-
mentation of the performance agreements 
(“Begleitgespräche”) in the autumn of 2017.

Continuing education at universities
Since 2014, the universities’ range of pro-
grammes and courses in the field of continuing 
education was further expanded. Quality as-
surance is ensured because continuing educa-
tion activities of universities are included in the 
audits which are obligatory for all universities 
according to the Act on Quality Assurance in 
Higher Education (HS-QSG). Furthermore, a 
great number of accreditations of certificate 
university programmes for further education 
for which a master’s degree is awarded, were 
carried out on a voluntary basis, the focus be-
ing on MBA programmes.

The continuing education programmes of-
fered by universities take into account the dif-
ferent needs of their target groups as well as 
the economic demand. The interest in certifi-
cate university programmes has further in-
creased; in the winter semester 2016 more 
than 20,000 students took advantage of these 
offerings (+6.7% compared to 2013). In contin-
uing education there is a trend towards 
high-quality training and trainings to enhance 
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qualifications; the increase in students in cer-
tificate university programmes for further edu-
cation, for which a master’s degree is awarded, 
is significantly higher than in other certificate 
university programmes for further education. 
Apart from the Danube University Krems being 
a university for continuing education, the Uni-
versities of Salzburg, Klagenfurt and Vienna as 
well as the Vienna University of Economics and 
Business are the most important providers of 
continuing education in the university sector. 
Certificate university programmes for further 
education address postgraduate students as 
well as non-academics and often take into ac-
count relevant (working) experience. This is il-
lustrated by the age of the students: More than 
70% of the students in such certificate univer-
sity programmes are over 30 years old.

Within the performance agreement period 
2013–2015, the universities have successfully 
started to link their programmes offered in 
continuing education to their institutional de-
velopment planning, also taking into account 
their respective LLL strategy. During the period 
of 2016–2018, the universities will continue to 
implement and further develop more focused 
institutional LLL strategies. Another priority 
are projects in the fields of “responsible uni-
versity“ and “entrepreneurial university“, 
which involve the regional economy. 

Since 2014, following a programme accredi-
tation by the AQ Austria, the Danube Universi-
ty Krems offers two PhD programmes – in the 
research fields “migration studies“ and “regen-
erative medicine“. In the winter semester 2016 
nine students were enrolled. Two more PhD 
programmes are being developed, which shall 
be ready by the end of 2018: “cultural herit-
age“ and “educational research and LLL“.

6 Students and graduates

Public universities remain to be the most dom-
inant part, quantitatively, of the higher educa-
tion sector: They provide 60% of the degree 
programmes, train 79% of all students and 
award nearly two thirds of all degrees awarded 
per year. The number of students at public uni-
versities has further risen over the last years, 
and the “Higher Education Forecast” of Statis-
tics Austria anticipates further growth. 

However, the growth of the university 
budget in the past ten years was not able to 
match the student numbers. The developments 
of some key indicators during the last years 
suggest that the efficiency losses already 
known continue to exist, adding to the pres-
sure on the university system: The proportion 

of students actively taking examinations has 
risen less significantly than forecasted in the 
Austrian National Development Plan for Public 
Universities, the number of graduations and 
the success rates have declined. Students are 
staying in the “system university“ longer than 
manageable for the system under the current 
conditions. Easing effects due to the demo-
graphic developments cannot be expected, and 
given the current framework conditions in the 
higher education sector, participation in higher 
education, which is forecasted to rise further, 
will continue to strongly affect the public uni-
versities. Therefore, it will be necessary to 
adapt the framework conditions of the public 
university system, be it by implementing pro-
jects such as the initiative “Shaping HEIs for 
the Future“, which aims at a discharge by fur-
ther expanding the university of applied scienc-
es sector, be it by implementing a new funding 
model for universities, be it by strategic instru-
ments for capacity and development planning 
of universities.

At the same time, the universities are called 
upon to monitor the study progress of their 
students and to use the results to enhance 
studyability, quality and efficiency, thus con-
tributing to an increase in the proportion of 
students who finish their studies.

The participation in university education has 
further increased during the last years – around 
30% of an age cohort are currently beginning a 
university degree programme. However, not all 
social groups participate to the same extent – 
this is no Austria-specific phenomenon, but can 
be observed in other countries as well. Statistic 
findings and sociological surveys – most re-
cently the 2015 Social Survey of Students – 
prove that the social background and especially 
the parents’ education have a significant effect 
on the educational career, and also influence 
the decision to study at a university as well as 
the choice of studies. In addition, the regional 
background and the availability of educational 
institutions in the immediate vicinity have an 
influence on these decisions. 

The universities are confronted with a great 
heterogeneity and diversity of their students. 
The different forms of employment and of the 
life and family situation of the students result 
in different needs, which affect the design of 
the curricula and the organisation of studies, 
time management, and student support. In 
view of the increasing degree of internationali-
sation among the student body, the students’ 
linguistic and cultural background is another 
aspect of diversity that has gained in impor-
tance. 
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The universities are facing the challenge of 
adapting the initial stage of studying, study en-
vironment and institutional framework condi-
tions to the needs of underrepresented groups 
so that they may participate adequately and 
effectively take advantage of courses and pro-
grammes offered. This is also an objective de-
fined in the “National strategy on the social di-
mension of higher education“ of the Federal 
Ministry of Science, Research and Economy 
(BMWFW). The ministry will promote appropri-
ate measures at universities by way of perfor-
mance agreements. Furthermore, it will be es-
sential that the universities establish a suitable 
form of monitoring the diversity of their stu-
dents and include diversity data in their moni-
toring instruments – all the more, as the social 
diversification shall be taken into account in 
the new model for university financing.

The universities’ position in the tertiary 
sector
Tertiary education in Austria is dominated by 
the higher education sector, which is composed 
of the 22 public universities, 21 universities of 
applied sciences, 14 university colleges of 
teacher education and 12 private universities. 
Within the higher education sector, the public 
universities play a dominant role. 60% of the 
degree programmes in the higher education 
sector are offered at public universities, 60% 
of the new entrants in the academic years of 
2016/17 began their studies at a public univer-
sity, 79% of the students are found in the uni-
versity sector, and 64% of the degrees are 
awarded at public universities. 

At public universities, the average duration 
of studies or enrolment is significantly high: In 
average, slightly more than half of the begin-
ners in a bachelor degree programme at public 
universities graduate within 14 semesters, an-
other fifth is still studying at that point. In com-
parison, at universities of applied sciences and 
university colleges of teacher education, three 
quarters of the bachelor students finish their 
studies within the minimum duration of the de-
gree programme or with a slight delay. No stu-
dent takes longer than 12 semesters for the 
successful completion of their bachelor degree 
programme. The disparities in the study pat-
terns of different types of higher education in-
stitution are caused by their different admis-
sion regulations and the different organisation 
of degree programmes (e.g. cohorts/”classes” 
at universities of applied sciences and universi-
ty colleges of  teacher education).

Access to public universities
48% of the holders of an Austrian secondary 
school leaving certificate (“Maturanten”), (49% 
of female holders, 47% of  male holders) begin 
a degree programme at a public university 
within three semesters (51% within five se-
mesters) after having earned their certificate. 
The highest entrance rate is found in second-
ary school graduates having completed their 
education at an Academic Secondary School 
(AHS Langform) (75% within three semesters). 
The entrance rate in secondary school gradu-
ates having finished a College for Higher Voca-
tional Education (BHS) is currently at 35%. 
Consequently, among all new entrants in 
2016/17, AHS school graduates are the largest 
group with a share of 54%.

In the academic year of 2016/17 50,179 stu-
dents from Austria and abroad have been ad-
mitted to a degree programme or a non-de-
gree programme at an Austrian public universi-
ty for the first time, among them 41,314 “new 
entrants” to a regular degree programme (“or-
dentliche Erstzugelassene”). During the re-
porting period, the number of new entries at 
public universities per year initially increased 
slightly, but most recently declined (-4.8% 
compared to 2013/14); considering only “new 
entrants” beginning a regular degree pro-
gramme, there has also been a decline in 
2016/17 (–2.1% compared to 2013/14). A change 
in statistical counting in the winter semester 
2016, which was necessary for statistically re-
cording the joint study programmes of the new 
teacher training, has presumably contributed 
to these declines in numbers. The development 
since the academic year of 2014/15 shows that 
the downward trend is higher in Austrian new 
entrants than in foreign new entrants, where 
there was a significant increase in the number 
of new entrants to non-degree programmes in 
connection with the MORE initiative for refu-
gees and asylum seekers from conflict areas. 
The proportion of new entrants from abroad 
has increased from 44% to 46% since the aca-
demic year 2013/14.

The “first matriculation quota“ (Austrian 
new entrants to degree programmes at public 
universities in relation to the mean age group 
of 18- to 21-year-old Austrian resident popula-
tion) is regarded as an indicator for participa-
tion in university education and amounted to 
29.8% in the academic year of 2016/17. The 
quota has further increased compared to the 
academic year of 2013/14 (28.9%). 62% of for-
eign persons beginning a degree programme 
come from EU member countries (among them 
27% or 6,202 persons from Germany). 
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36.6% of those beginning a degree pro-
gramme in the winter semester 2016 chose a 
study in the field of “social sciences, economics 
and law“. 28.2% began their studies in a so-
called STEM subject (ISCED-fields of education 
“natural sciences“ and “engineering, manufac-
turing, construction“). Although the total num-
ber of new entries to bachelor and diploma de-
gree programmes in the winter semester 2013 
declined compared to the winter semester 2016 
by about 3%, new entries to STEM studies 
gained 4%. 31.2% of the new students had en-
rolled in one of the 10 most popular studies 
(law, economics and social sciences, English 
and American studies, pedagogics, German 
philology, historical studies, business law, biol-
ogy, psychology and informatics). More than 
half of the new students in the winter semester 
2016 (56.6%) chose a degree programme out 
of the group of the 20 most popular studies. 

As a result of the changeover to degree pro-
grammes structured according to the Bologna 
system, 86% of all new students who begin a 
degree programme leading to a first degree 
are enrolled in a bachelor degree programme 
and only 14% in a diploma degree programme, 
with legal and medical studies representing the 
largest part of the diploma studies.

Students 
Since the winter semester 2013, the total num-
ber of students at public universities has fur-
ther increased by 3.3% to 308,000 students 
(winter semester 2016: 308,374 Austrian and 
foreign degree- and non-degree-seeking stu-
dents). The increase can be attributed largely 
to foreign students; most recently 28.7% of the 
degree- and non-degree-seeking students 
came from abroad. 66% of the foreign stu-
dents (enrolled in degree programmes and 
non-degree programmes) are from EU member 
states. 

280,783 persons, among them 205,042 Aus-
trians, were enrolled in a regular degree pro-
gramme, the proportion of foreign students be-
ing 27%. There has been a decline in the num-
ber of Austrian students over the past two 
years, while the number of foreign students has 
further increased (by 10.2% since the winter se-
mester 2013). 

In the winter semester 2016 55% of the stu-
dents were enrolled in bachelor degree pro-
grammes, 19% in diploma degree programmes, 
18% in master degree programmes and 8% in 
doctoral degree programmes.

The number of students who actively take 
examinations has increased during the report-
ing period by 2.3%. The proportion of students 

who actively take examinations in relation to 
all students enrolled is an indicator for the de-
gree of study activity and averages 53% during 
the reporting period. Calculations which com-
pare the number of students actively taking 
examinations with the number of enrolments 
illustrate that at universities or in the fields of 
education where admission regulations are in 
place (pursuant to § 71c or § 71d UG 2002) or 
which require an aptitude test (pursuant to § 
63 UG 2002), the proportion of students active-
ly taking examinations is significantly above 
average (at medical universities and universi-
ties of arts between 76% and 87%).

Graduates 
The number of graduates has declined within 
the reporting period. A total of 35,864 gradua-
tions in the academic year of 2015/16 mean a 
decline by 3.9% compared to 2012/13. The de-
cline can be explained by the discontinuation of 
a number of diploma degree programmes  as of 
2013/14 and the phenomenon that for this rea-
son students had prioritized the completion of 
these diploma degree programmes – so in the 
academic year of 2012/13 a new maximum of 
37,312 graduations had been reached. Also the 
sharp decline of the success rates, from a max-
imum of 86.5% in the academic year 2012/13 to 
62.8% in the academic year 2015/16, must be 
seen in this context. 

The proportion of female graduates has de-
creased and came in at 55%. The number of 
foreign graduates has increased as compared 
to 2012/13, presenting 25% of all graduations. 
In the academic year of 2015/16 there were 
16,848 graduates of bachelor degree pro-
grammes, that is an increase by 4% during the 
reporting period. A proportion of already 47% 
of all graduates has completed a bachelor de-
gree programme. The number of graduations 
in master degree programmes (9,545 in the ac-
ademic year of 2015/16) continues to grow 
(+60% in the reporting period), while the num-
ber of graduations in diploma degree pro-
grammes is falling (–44%). Graduations in doc-
toral degree programmes have remained at a 
constant level of about 2,200 per year through-
out the reporting period. The proportion of fe-
male doctoral graduates was 41.9%, the pro-
portion of foreign graduates of 33% was above 
average, indicating the appeal of a doctoral 
training at an Austrian university.

In the academic year of 2015/16 the average 
duration of a degree programme was 8.0 se-
mesters for bachelor degree programmes and 
5.6 semesters for master degree programmes 
and has remained nearly unchanged. In diplo-
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ma degree programmes the average duration 
declined nearly by one semester to 13 semes-
ters, also showing the effects of the discontin-
uation of diploma studies. Doctoral degree pro-
grammes were completed after an average of 9 
semesters. 

67% of the graduates having completed a 
bachelor degree programme in the academic 
year of 2014/15 continued their studies by the 
summer semester of 2017 with a master de-
gree programme – a declining trend (gradua-
tion year 2008/09 81%, graduation year 2011/12 
73%). According to the 2015 Social Survey of 
Students, around 16% of the graduates having 
completed their diploma or master degree pro-
gramme take up a doctoral degree programme 
within two years. 

Diversity of the student body 
The student body at public universities is char-
acterised by heterogeneity and diversity. This 
results in different needs of students which 
university institutions are facing, affecting the 
organisation of studies, time management and 
support of students. In the performance agree-
ments 2016–2018 the BMWFW has taken up 
these issues by agreeing on university-specific 
measures. These issues will remain in focus. 
The monitoring of student diversity and heter-
ogeneity by the individual universities is a key 
element of quality enhancement and quality 
assurance in teaching and the organisation of 
studies.

Age of students
77.8% of the students are under 30 years, 
15.7% between 30 and 40 years, and 6.5% are 
40 years or older. The age structure and mean 
age differ, depending on the type of studies. 
On average, Austrian students in bachelor de-
gree programmes are 22 years old (winter se-
mester 2016), students in diploma studies 24 
years old, students in master degree pro-
grammes 26 years old. The mean age of wom-
en is lower, as men usually begin their studies 
later owing to the fact that they have to com-
plete their compulsory community or military 
service and also take longer to complete their 
studies. Doctoral students are 32 years old on 
average.

The mean age of Austrian new entrants to a 
bachelor or diploma degree programme is 
19  years (winter semester 2016). 82% begin 
their studies at a public university immediately 
(i.e. within two years) following their second-
ary school leaving examination, 18% have de-
layed the beginning of their studies. The pro-
portion of persons having delayed the begin-

ning of their studies (“non-traditional appli-
cants“) is on the rise. 

Social background of students
Participation in university education is influ-
enced by many factors, including professional 
interest, regional course offerings, financing of 
studies, compatibility of studying with care 
commitments and employment, as well as the 
socio-economic background. “Educational in-
heritance“ mostly takes effect already in the 
preceding school system, resulting in  selec-
tion mechanisms, and also has an impact on 
university access (and subsequently also on 
study progress).

Persons whose parents do not have higher 
education entrance qualifications are signifi-
cantly underrepresented in access to (public) 
universities by a factor of 2.7 compared to per-
sons with parents having higher education en-
trance qualifications. Improving this recruit-
ment quota is one of the goals defined in im-
pact-oriented budgeting and also in the Nation-
al strategy on the social dimension of higher 
education. However, compared to the rest of 
Europe, Austria is even among the countries, in 
which the composition of the student body rep-
resents that of the resident population to a rel-
atively large extent.

Over the period of 2011/12 to 2014/15, an 
average of 8% of the new entrants at public 
universities were students, whose fathers did 
not have a formal education beyond compulso-
ry schooling, and 43% whose fathers have a 
medium level of education; they are therefore 
underrepresented compared to the distribu-
tion in the fathers’ generation. Among the new 
entrants, there were 21% whose fathers have 
a higher education entrance qualification and 
28% having a university degree, while in the 
fathers’ generation (40- to 65-year-old male 
residents) only 14% have a higher education 
entrance qualification and 11% have a univer-
sity degree. The educational background and 
socio-economic factors also influence the 
choice of type of higher education institution 
and the choice of studies. At medical universi-
ties, universities of arts as well as at universi-
ties in Vienna in general, new entrants come 
from educated families more often than aver-
age.

Refugee initiative “MORE“
Since the winter semester 2015, universities 
have special offerings for asylum seekers and 
persons entitled to asylum. Within the frame of 
the refugee initiative “MORE“ by Universities 
Austria (uniko), they offer language trainings, 
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sport activities, easy access to selected regu-
lar courses, and other support. In the winter 
semester 2015, 633 persons took part in the 
MORE programme. This number has risen in 
the summer semester 2016 to 1,106 and de-
clined again in the following semesters. In the 
summer semester 2017, a total of 738 persons 
were enrolled as MORE students, most of which 
come from Syria, Iraq and Afghanistan.

Employment and financial situation
Working during the semester or during the hol-
idays has become an integral part of everyday 
university life for the vast majority of students. 
According to the 2015 Social Survey of Stu-
dents, 62% of students at universities work 
during the semester in addition to their stud-
ies, nearly 48% of which are employed and 
14% only work occasionally during the semes-
ter. 38% do not work during the semester. The 
average working time of a student, who is em-
ployed during the semester, is 19 weekly hours. 
The employment rate (i.e. the proportion of 
students working) as well as the working hours 
increase with the age of the students.

Around two thirds of all working students 
consider themselves primarily as students, 
around one third as employed persons who 
also study. Among all students, including the 
non-working students, this percentage 
amounts to 20%.

Three quarters of the working students 
state that their employment is necessary to fi-
nance the cost of living; 61% state that they 
work in order to be able to afford a little more; 
about half of them want to gain work experi-
ence (multiple entries were possible). With the 
double burden of studying and working, many 
are facing a higher total weekly workload. From 
a time perspective, employment has a nega-
tive effect on the students’ time dedicated for 
studying. Around 54% of the working survey 
participants at universities stated that they 
have difficulties to combine work with their 
studies.

In 2015 students at a public university had 
at their disposal an income of around €1,100 on 
average (on average €968 ready money, and 
benefits in kind equivalent of €133). The main 
source of income is their own gainful employ-
ment, representing an average of 41% of the 
students’ overall budget; an average of 24% 
are cash payments received by the family, 12% 
are benefits in kind. With increasing age the fi-
nancial support provided by the family de-
creases, while the income from own gainful 
employment becomes more important. Due to 
their own income, older students therefore 

have on average higher monthly means than 
younger students.

Students with children
Among all students, 9.5% have at least one 
child, among which most students have a child 
(or children) under the age of 15 years living in 
the same household. Studying parents are on 
average more than 10  years older than stu-
dents without children. The employment rate, 
i.e. the proportion of students who are em-
ployed or work occasionally during the semes-
ter, is at 86% in student fathers and at 64% in 
student mothers. The employment rate and 
weekly working time of mothers strongly cor-
relates with the age of their youngest children 
– the older the child, the higher the employ-
ment rate.

The time budget of students with child(ren) 
is composed differently owing to the fact that 
in addition to time requirements for studying 
and the weekly working hours, time must also 
be invested in child care. With a regard to the 
hours spent on studying, there are no gender 
differences. Student mothers, however, spend 
more time on child care, student fathers have 
higher weekly working hours.

Students with disabilities or with chronic 
diseases 
The Universities Act 2002 has defined guiding 
principles stipulating, among others, that spe-
cial attention must be given to the needs of the 
handicapped. At nearly all universities there 
are disability officers for students or special 
centres, to which students with disabilities, 
health impaired students, or students with 
chronic diseases may turn to. According to the 
2015 Social Survey of Students, 12% of the 
students stated that they have one or more 
health impairments, which limit their options or 
make studying more difficult; that amounts to 
a projected number of about 36,760 persons, 
among which, according to their own state-
ments, 6% have a disability (that is only 0.8% 
of all students, totalling around 2,200 persons). 
The measures of the individual universities for 
students with disabilities or chronic diseases 
include special information leaflets, online 
course offerings, the provision of barrier-free 
working and study conditions, as well as the 
organisation of guidance and tutoring. All these 
measures are also an integral part of the per-
formance agreements. At the Vienna Universi-
ty of Technology,  students of all higher educa-
tion institutions in Vienna with hearing impair-
ments as well as deaf students receive com-
prehensive support provided by the GESTU 
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project (Gehörlos Erfolgreich STUdieren, suc-
cessfully studying for deaf people). 

2017 Higher Education Forecast
In 2017 Statistics Austria carried out the third 
Higher Education Forecast on behalf of the BM-
WFW, forecasting important quantitative de-
velopments in the Austrian higher education 
area until 2035/36. It includes Austrian stu-
dents as well as students from abroad studying 
at public universities, universities of applied 
sciences, university colleges of teacher educa-
tion and private universities, with a particular 
focus on the development of the number of 
people with a university entrance qualification 
from Germany.

The basis for the Higher Education Forecast 
is the forecast on the numbers of pupils taking 
the secondary school leaving examination (Ma-
tura) after completing their upper level sec-
ondary or vocational education. In this context 
it is decisive that the number of persons of the 
typical age for the secondary school leaving 
examination is tending to decrease during the 
forecast horizon, but that this will be compen-
sated, seeing that every year a larger propor-
tion of pupils choose school types leading to a 
secondary school leaving examination. The 
proportion of pupils having taken secondary 
school leaving examination in the average age 
cohort will increase over the coming decades 
from around 43% (2015) to about 51% in 2035. 
In 2035 around 48,000 persons will take their 
secondary school leaving examination. On av-
erage, around 73% of all pupils having taken 
their secondary school leaving examination at 
an Academic Secondary School (Allgemeinbil-
dende höhere Schule AHS) begin a degree pro-
gramme at a public university within three 
years. This quota is 35% for those having taken 
their secondary school leaving examination at 
a College for Engineering, Arts and Crafts (hö-
here technisch-gewerbliche Schule BHS), 43% 
for those having taken it at a College for Busi-
ness Administration (höhere kaufmännische 
Schule BHS), and 22% for those at a  Kinder-
garten Teacher Training College or College for 
Social Education (LHS). Most of those having 
passed their secondary school leaving exami-
nation and entering higher education begin a 
degree programme at a public university. Pu-
pils having completed a LHS school very often 
choose a university college of teacher educa-
tion, whereas BHS graduates more often 
choose universities of applied sciences.

With a view to the number of persons begin-
ning a degree programme at an Austrian high-
er education institution for the first time 

(around 67,700 in the academic year 2015/16), 
the number of new entrants at universities of 
applied sciences, university colleges of teacher 
education, and private universities will remain 
nearly unchanged until 2035/36, according to 
the Higher Education Forecast. Only the num-
ber of new entrants at public universities will 
increase slightly by 2035/36 (from 53,100 in 
2015/16 to 57,600 in 2035/36). The number of 
new entrants with a German citizenship will 
presumably remain at the 2015/16 level.

The survey anticipates that the total num-
ber of students at universities, universities of 
applied sciences, university colleges of teacher 
education and private universities will further 
increase, from an overall of approx. 370,000 
persons in the academic year 2015/16 to about 
423,000 persons by the academic year 2035/36. 
The increase is largely owing to a rise in Austri-
an students (from 282,000 students in 2015/16 
to approx. 314,000 by 2035/36); the proportion 
of foreign students is expected to remain con-
stant over the forecast period. Provided that 
the current admission regulations continue to 
exist, by the academic year 2035/36 around 
9% of all students (not including mobility stu-
dents) will be Germans, a further 8% will come 
from other EU member states and the propor-
tion of non-EU members will increase to 9%; 
nearly three quarters will be Austrians. An in-
crease in student numbers is expected in all 
sectors of higher education. At public universi-
ties the number of students in the academic 
year 2035/36 will be higher by 18% compared 
to 2015/16, at universities of applied sciences 
by 24%, and at university colleges of teacher 
education by 9%. The forecasted increase for 
private universities is 67%.

The number of graduations at higher educa-
tion institutions is still growing. The increase is 
mainly due to the higher numbers of gradua-
tions at universities, which is explained partly 
by the successful changeover to degree pro-
grammes structured according to the Bologna 
system (instead of graduating once in a diplo-
ma degree programme, students now often 
complete a bachelor degree programme and 
after that a master degree programme). Ac-
cording to the prognosis, the number of gradu-
ates will further increase over the years to 
come, by 16% at public universities (at univer-
sities of applied sciences by 20%, at university 
colleges of teacher education by 9%, and at 
private universities by 58%). This growth is 
mainly based on an increase in successfully 
completed bachelor and master degree pro-
grammes. The number of completed diploma 
studies is projected to decline. The number of 
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